

The Regular meeting of the Township Council of the Township of Livingston was held on the above date commencing at 7:40 p.m. The Mayor read the statement of compliance with the Sunshine Law N.J.S.A. 10:4-10 and stated that notice of this meeting has been given in accordance with the “Open Public Meetings Law”, and that Annual Notice was faxed to the West Essex Tribune and the Star Ledger on January 6, 2022.

A Quorum Roll Call was held.

	Present	Absent
Mayor Meinhardt	X	
Deputy Mayor Vieira	X	
Councilmember Anthony	X	
Councilmember Fernandez	X	
Councilmember Klein	X	

Also present were professionals Township Manager Lewis, Deputy Township Manager Jones, Assistant Township Manager Loehner, Township Attorney Kantor, and Township Clerk Mazzucco.

Moment of Silence and Pledge of Allegiance

Mayor Meinhardt asked everyone to stand for a Moment of Silence, followed by the Pledge of Allegiance.

Mayor Meinhardt welcomed the new Assistant Township Manager Adam Loehner, and thanked the Township Department of Public Works Superintendent Chris Southworth, for the hard work and dedication of his department, and the councilmembers echoed his sentiments.

Essex County Updates & Communications

Eileen Fishman, Essex County Liaison to Livingston Liaison to Essex County Executive Joseph Di Vincenzo, advised of upcoming County events as well as COVID vaccine updates.

Proclamations & Presentations

1) Jessica Oji – LHS Track Team State Champion. The assistant coach of track and field at Livingston High School Eugene Assimou commended Ms. Oji on her standout year as a freshman shot putter, who is ranked 4th in the State of New Jersey.

2) Carnegie Hall Dance Recital – Krupa Patel and Nidhi Ladda, both students of teacher Guru Bina Menon were honored for their years of dedication in dance and their performance at Carnegie Hall in New York City.

2022 Municipal Budget Introduction

Resolution 22-187a Introduce the Municipal Budget

BE IT RESOLVED that the statements of revenue and appropriations attached hereto constitute the local Budget of the Township of Livingston, County of Essex, State of New Jersey, for the year 2022, as introduced and approved by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that said Budget be published in the West Essex Tribune, and that a hearing on the Budget be held on August 8, 2022 at 7:30 o'clock p.m. at Livingston Town Hall, 357 S Livingston Ave, Livingston, NJ which is the opportunity for interested persons to make comments at the public hearing. The meeting will also be viewable (without the opportunity to comment) via Livestream from Facebook @ facebook.com/LivingstonTownshipNJ.

Resolution 22-187b To Establish 2022 Municipal Open Space Tax Rate

WHEREAS, a referendum was approved by the residents of the Township of Livingston in November, 2002 to establish a Municipal Open Space, Recreation, Farmland and Historic Preservation Trust Fund; and,

WHEREAS, a referendum was approved by the residents of the Township of Livingston in November, 2008 to permit the Municipal Open Space, Recreation, Farmland and Historic Preservation Trust Fund to continue in perpetuity; and,

WHEREAS, The Municipal Open Space, Recreation, Farmland and Historic Preservation Trust Fund is to be funded through an annual tax levy not to exceed three cents (\$0.03) per one hundred dollars (\$100) of assessed valuation;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston, County of Essex, State of New Jersey, that the 2022 Municipal Open Space, Recreation, Farmland and Historic Preservation Trust Fund tax levy shall be one-half cent (\$0.005) per one hundred dollars (\$100) of assessed valuation.

Resolution 22-187c Self-Examination of 2022 Budget

WHEREAS, N.J.S.A. 40A:4-78b has authorized the Local Finance Board to adopt rules that permit municipalities in sound fiscal condition to assume the responsibility, normally granted to the Director of the Division of Local Government Services, of conducting the annual budget examination; and

WHEREAS, N.J.A.C. 5:30-7 was adopted by the Local Finance Board on February 11, 1997; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-7.2 through 7.5, the Township of Livingston has been declared eligible to participate in the program by the Division of Local government Services, and the Chief Financial Officer has determined that the local government meets the necessary conditions to participate in the program for the 2022 budget year.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the governing body of the Township of Livingston that in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-7.6a & 7.6b and based upon the Chief

Financial Officer's certification, the Township Council has found the budget has met the following requirements:

1. That with reference to the following items, the amounts have been calculated pursuant to law and appropriated as such in the budget:
 - a. Payment of interest and debt redemption charges
 - b. Deferred charges and statutory expenditures
 - c. Cash deficit of preceding year
 - d. Reserve for uncollected taxes
 - e. Other reserves and non-disbursement items
 - f. Any inclusions of amounts required for school purposes.
2. That the provisions relating to limitation on increases of appropriations pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:4-45.2 and appropriations for exceptions to limits on appropriations found at N.J.S.A. 40A:4-45.3 et seq., are fully met (complies with CAP law).
3. That the budget is in such form, arrangement, and content as required by the Local Budget Law and N.J.A.C. 5:30-4 and 5:30-5.
4. That pursuant to the Local Budget Law:
 - a. All estimates of revenue are reasonable, accurate and correctly stated,
 - b. Items of appropriation are properly set forth
 - c. In itemization, form, arrangement and content, the budget will permit the exercise of the comptroller function within the municipality.
5. The budget and associated amendments have been introduced and publicly advertised in accordance with the relevant provisions of the Local Budget Law, except that failure to meet the deadlines of N.J.S.A. 40A:4-5 shall not prevent such certification.
6. That all other applicable statutory requirements have been fulfilled.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a copy of this resolution will be forwarded to the Director of the Division of Local Government Services upon adoption.

Resolution 22-187d Computing 2022 Reserve for Uncollected Taxes

WHEREAS, N.J.S.A. 40A:4-41 enacted into law (P.L. 1997, c. 28), provides alternate methods of calculating the reserve for uncollected taxes,

WHEREAS, one method under N.J.S.A. 40A:4-41 permits a three year average to be used to determine the amount required for the reserve for uncollected taxes for municipalities to which subsection C of this section is not applicable,

WHEREAS, the Township of Livingston has determined that it is advantageous for the Township of Livingston to utilize the method under N.J.S.A. 40A:4-41c1,

WHEREAS the Township of Livingston had the following three year percentage of tax collections; 2019 - 99.70%; 2020 - 99.58% and 2021 - 98.25%,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston that the maximum percentage to be used for the reserve for uncollected taxes in the 2022 Budget is 99.17% based on N.J.S.A. 40A:4-41c1.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston that the Director of the Division of Local Government Services in the Department

of Community Affairs be and is hereby requested to give her written consent to allow the Township of Livingston to compute the Reserve for Uncollected Taxes pursuant to the provisions of N.J.S.A. 40A:4-41c1.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this resolution be uploaded on the FAST System for the Director of the Division of Local Government Services.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on roll call vote, resolutions 22-187a through 187d were adopted.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt	X		
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein	X		

Approval of Minutes, Pending Any Corrections

On motion duly made and seconded, and on voice vote, the Council approved the following, pending any corrections:

- 1) June 20, 2022 Regular and Conference Minutes
- 2) June 20, 2022 Closed Session 1 and Session 2 Minutes
- 3) June 30, 2022 Special Meeting Minutes

Public Portion (Agenda Items Only—4 Minute Limit)

On motion duly made and seconded, and by voice vote, the hearing on the Public Portion was opened.

Township Clerk Mazzucco read comments from Justin Alpert, 56 Amherst Place regarding various questions on resolutions and the pool utility ordinance on tonight's July 11, 2022 agenda.

On motion duly made and seconded and on voice vote, the public portion on Agenda items was closed.

Passage of Ordinances

Final Hearing/2nd Reading

There were none.

Introduction of Ordinances

Ord 17-2022 Bond Ordinance Providing an Appropriation of \$525,000 for Pool Utility Improvements was read by title.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on Roll Call vote, all members present voted yes. It was ordered advertised according to law, to come up for public hearing second reading and final consideration at a Regular meeting of the Township Council on Monday, July 25, 2022.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt	X		
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein	X		

Ord 18-2022 Bond Ordinance Providing an Appropriation of \$2,890,000 for Water Utility Improvements was read by title.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on Roll Call vote, all members present voted yes. It was ordered advertised according to law, to come up for public hearing second reading and final consideration at a Regular meeting of the Township Council on Monday, July 25, 2022.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt	X		
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein	X		

Ord 19-2022 Bond Ordinance Providing an Appropriation of \$3,750,000 for Sewer Utility Improvements was read by title.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on Roll Call vote, all members present voted yes. It was ordered advertised according to law, to come up for public hearing second reading and final consideration at a Regular meeting of the Township Council on Monday, July 25, 2022.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt	X		
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein	X		

Ord 20-2022 Ordinance Of The Township Of Livingston Amending Chapter 2, Article IV, §2-12 of the Township Code was read by title.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on Roll Call vote, all members present voted yes. It was ordered advertised according to law, to come up for public hearing second

reading and final consideration at a Regular meeting of the Township Council on Monday, July 25, 2022.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt	X		
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein	X		

Ord 21-2022 Exceed Calendar Year 2022 Municipal Budget Appropriation Limits and To Establish a CAP Bank was read by title.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on Roll Call vote, all members present voted yes. It was ordered advertised according to law, to come up for public hearing second reading and final consideration at a Regular meeting of the Township Council on Monday, July 25, 2022.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt	X		
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein	X		

Ord 22-2022 Approving The Application For A Long-Term Tax Exemption And Authorizing The Financial Agreement Related To A Redevelopment Project Located at 630 Nish Route 10 In The Township was read by title.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on Roll Call vote, three council members present voted yes, and two abstained. Councilmember Klein mentioned that he thinks this is a great project but unfortunately due to false accusations made towards him and his campaign he will abstain from voting on this ordinance. Mayor Meinhardt stated he will also abstain from this evening's vote. It was ordered advertised according to law, to come up for public hearing second reading and final consideration at a Regular meeting of the Township Council on Monday, July 25, 2022.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt			X
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein			X

Resolutions

Res 22-188 Consent Agenda for Resolutions

WHEREAS, the Township Council of the Township of Livingston has determined that certain items on its agenda which have the unanimous approval of all Councilmembers and do not require comment shall be termed the "Consent Agenda"; and

WHEREAS, the Township Council has determined that to increase its efficiency, the Consent Agenda shall be adopted with one resolution;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council that the items on the regular agenda for July 11, 2022 attached hereto, which are preceded by an "*" are the Consent Agenda and are hereby accepted, approved and/or adopted.

*Res 22-189 Firefighting Grant for \$75,000 for Turnout Gear and SCBA's (Self-Contained Breathing Apparatus)

WHEREAS, the Township of Livingston desires to apply for and obtain a grant from the New Jersey Department of Community Affairs for approximately \$75,000 to carry out a project to purchase turnout gear and SCBA's (Self-Contained Breathing Apparatus) for firefighting purposes;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED;

1. That the Township of Livingston does hereby authorize the application for such a grant; and,
2. Recognizes and accepts that the Department may offer a lesser or greater amount and therefore, upon receipt of the grant agreement from the New Jersey Department of Community Affairs, does further authorize the execution of any such grant agreement; and also, upon receipt of the fully executed agreement from the Department, does further authorize the expenditure of funds pursuant to the terms of the agreement between the Township of Livingston and the New Jersey Department of Community Affairs.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the persons whose names, titles, and signatures appear below are authorized to sign the application, and that they or their successors in said titles are authorized to sign the agreement, and any other documents necessary in connection therewith:

*Res 22-190 (Intentionally Left Blank)

*Res 22-191 Authorizing Alcoholic Beverages in Designated Public Areas

WHEREAS, the Council of the Township of Livingston (the "Council") amended and supplemented the language of the Code of the Township of Livingston, Chapter 61 Alcoholic Beverages, Article IV Public Recreation Areas (the "Code"), by adopting Ordinance 23-2021; and

WHEREAS, the Council may allow by Resolution the consumption of beer and wine to be sold by an authorized vendor in a designated location for a particular date/time; and

WHEREAS, the Township of Livingston Summerfest event previously scheduled for June 12, 2022 was canceled due to inclement weather; and

WHEREAS, the Township of Livingston Summerfest event has been rescheduled for Saturday,

September 10, 2022; and

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and the Township Council of the Township of Livingston, County of Essex, State of New Jersey that the Council hereby authorizes the consumption of beer and wine sold by an authorized vendor as follows:

- i) Summerfest: September 10, 2022, from 12 pm to 4 pm in the location shown on Exhibit A

***Res 22-192 Authorizing Approval of CO #1 and Final with Ischia Corp for Two-Inch Mill and Pave of Sycamore Ave – Section Two**

WHEREAS, the Township Council of the Township of Livingston entered into a contract (“CONTRACT”) with Ischia Corporation for the Two Inch Mill and Pave of Sycamore Avenue – Section Two; and

WHEREAS, the initial Contract was not to exceed Three Hundred Seventy Four Thousand, One Hundred Eighty Six, and Ten Cents; and

WHEREAS, due to changed field conditions, a Change Order has been requested for the following:

A.	SUPPLEMENTAL	
	Detectable Warning Surface	\$224.00
	Traffic Markings, Thermoplastic	\$140.00
	Total	\$364.00
B.	REDUCTIONS	
	Police Traffic Director	-\$15,480.00
	Fuel Price Adjustment	-\$2,245.79
	Asphalt Price Adjustment (To be utilized Only if Asphalt Tonnage Exceeds 1,000 Tons)	-\$3,300.00
	Excavation, Unclassified	-\$6.00
	Geotextile Fabric	-\$18.00
	Dense Graded Aggregate Base Course, Variable Thickness	-\$3.00
	Milling, 3” or Less	-\$3,029.75
	Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5M64 Surface Course	-\$7,578.60
	Hot Mix Asphalt 19M64 Base Course	-\$5.00
	8” PVC Pipe, Sch. 40	-\$2,205.00
	Roof Leader and Drain Connection to 8” PVC Pipe Under Drain	-\$200.00
	Bicycle Safe Grate	-\$10.00
	Bicycle Safe Grate	-\$400.00
	Curb Piece, Type N-Eco	-\$400.00
	Reconstructed Inlet, Type B Using New Casting	-\$0.01
	Yard Drain	-\$0.01
	Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 2” Thick	-\$6.28
	Driveway Restoration, Concrete Block	-\$0.50
	Concrete Driveway, Reinforced, 6” Thick	-\$1,749.75
	Concrete Sidewalk, 4” Thick	-\$3,666.75
	Hot Mix Asphalt Sidewalk, 4” Thick (As Needed For Restoration)	-\$0.64
	Granite Block Curb	-\$15,190.00
	Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Thermoplastic, 6” Width	-\$860.00
	Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Thermoplastic 12” Width	-\$7.00
	Top soiling, 4” Thick	-\$12.45
	Fertilizing and Seeding, Type “1”	-\$12.45

Total

-\$56,386.98

WHEREAS, the total change order decreased the contract amount by 14.97% or \$56,022.98; and

WHEREAS, this Change Order has been recommended by Jeannette Harduby, Township Engineer and Barry Lewis, Township Manager; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, the Township Council of the Township of Livingston, Essex County, approves the execution and payment of Change Order Number 1 and Final to the Contract with Ischia Corporation for the Two-Inch Mill and Pave of Sycamore Avenue – Section Two; that this resolution is without prejudice to any rights of the Township of Livingston, that the Township has, had, or may have to charge back or to seek cost of said change orders from third-party and the Township hereby reserves all of its rights hereto.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a copy of this resolution shall be published in the West Essex Tribune as required by law.

*Res 22-193 Approving a NJDOT Local Aid Grant for Milling & Paving of W Oakwood Ave

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Council of the Township of Livingston formally approves the grant application for the above stated project.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Township Manager and Clerk are hereby authorized to submit an electronic grant application identified as MA-2023-Milling and Paving – West Oakwood Avenue-00161 to the New Jersey Department of Transportation on behalf of the Township of Livingston.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Township Manager and Clerk are hereby authorized to sign the grant application on behalf of the Township of Livingston and their signature constitutes acceptance of the terms and conditions of the grant agreement and approves the execution of the grant agreement.

*Res 22-194 Authorizing a One –Yr Extension of Existing Contract with Bayshore Recycling

WHEREAS, on August 17, 2020 the Township Council of the Township of Livingston authorized the Township Manager to enter into a twelve-month contract with Bayshore Recycling, Corp. for the marketing of recyclable materials recovered through the Township’s recycling program; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the existing contract, the Township extended its contract for one year effective November 1, 2021 at the same prices bid; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the existing contract, the Township will exercise its option to extend its existing contract for an additional one year effective November 1, 2022 with Bayshore Recycling, Corp. at the same prices bid; and

WHEREAS, the Township Manager is recommending a one-year extension of the contract with Bayshore Recycling, Corp. at the same prices bid per the attached schedule of pricing; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston, in the County of Essex, State of New Jersey, that it authorizes the Township Manager to extend the contract with Bayshore Recycling, Corp. for one year effective November 1, 2022.

Bayshore Recycling Corp.
PO Box 290 75 Crowns Mill Road
Keasbey, NJ 08832

ITEM	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	EXTENSION
			Market Price		
1	1533.24	TON	Residential Mixed Paper (Current PPI Value (\$30) minus \$50) *	-\$20.00	-\$30,664.80
			Total Potential Annual Amount To Be Paid By Township - Market		-\$30,664.80
			Total Potential Monthly To Be Paid By Township - Market		-\$2,555.40
			Guaranteed Floor		
1	1145.74	TON	Commingled Bottles/Cans/Plastics	-\$39.00	-\$44,683.86
			TOTAL Minimum Potential Annual Amount To Be Paid By Township		-\$44,683.86
			Total Potential Monthly To Be Paid by Township- Floor Price		-\$3,723.66

***Res 22-195 Authorizing a Six-Month Extension of Existing Contract with Shaugger Property Services Inc**

WHEREAS, on February 22, 2022 the Township Council of the Township of Livingston authorized the Township Manager to enter into a six-month contract with Shauger Property Services, Inc. for the on-call sanitary sewer repairs at various locations; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the existing contract, the Township will exercise its option to extend its existing contract for six months effective September 1, 2022 at the same prices bid; and

WHEREAS, the Township Manager is recommending a six-month extension of the contract with Shauger Property Services, Inc. at the same prices bid per the attached schedule of pricing; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston, in the County of Essex, State of New Jersey, that it authorizes the Township Manager to extend the contract with Shauger Property Services, Inc. for six months effective September 1, 2022.

***Res 22-196 Authorizing the Award of a Contract to Ferguson Waterworks**

WHEREAS, the Township of Livingston (“Township”) has a need to purchase water and sewer system parts; and

WHEREAS, on June 9, 2022, the Township of Livingston issued Bid No. 10-2022 as an open-ended contract, to solicit bids from companies that supply water and sewer system parts; and

WHEREAS, the bid was advertised on the Township of Livingston website and West Essex Tribune on June 9, 2022 and as a result eight (8) bid packages were requested; and

WHEREAS, on June 29, 2022, one (1) bid was received by the bid deadline and publicly read; and

WHEREAS, the firm of Ferguson Waterworks was identified as the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for Sections 1-7 whose bid meets all of the requirements of the bid specifications, complies with the requirements of N.J.S.A. 10:5-31 et seq. and N.J.S.A. 17:27 et seq., is responsive and responsible; and

WHEREAS, Ferguson Waterworks' schedule of pricing is attached; and

WHEREAS, the Utility Engineer has evaluated the proposal for qualifications, experience, and cost reasonableness, and recommends the award of a contract to Ferguson Waterworks; and

WHEREAS, the Township Manager is recommending the award of a twelve (12) month contract to Ferguson Waterworks; and

WHEREAS, prior to incurring the liability by placing the order, the certification of availability of funds shall be made by the chief financial officer, as appropriate, per N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.5 (b) 2; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston, in the County of Essex, State of New Jersey, that it authorizes the Township Manager to enter into a twelve (12) month contract with Ferguson Waterworks effective August 1, 2022.

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE
SECTION 1 - Pipe			
1	4" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	20	\$40.00
2	6" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	100	\$31
3	8" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	400	\$ 43.00
4	10" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	40	\$ 56.00
5	12" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	100	\$ 71.00
6	16" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	20	\$ 100.00
ENTER Unit Price Total Here ->			\$ 298.00
SECTION 2 - Fittings			
1	6" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	15	\$ 347.00
2	8" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	15	\$ 550.00
3	8" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs	8	\$ 659.00
4	10" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$ 740.00
5	10" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$ 832.00
6	12" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	8	\$ 930.00
7	12" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	8	\$ 1,032.00
8	12" X 10" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$ 2,295.00
9	12" X 12" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	8	\$ 935.00
10	6" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$ 233.00
11	8" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$ 300.00
12	10" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$ 394.00
13	12" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	3	\$ 470.00
14	4" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$ 150.00
15	6" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$ 211.00
16	8" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$ 287.00
17	10" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$ 400.00
18	12" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$ 545.00
19	4" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$ 150.00
20	6" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$ 210.00

21	8" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$	297.00
22	10" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	2	\$	426.00
23	12" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$	560.00
24	4" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$	155.00
25	6" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	214.00
26	8" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	300.00
27	10" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$	245.00
28	12" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	593.00
29	4" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$	168.00
30	6" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	230.00
31	8" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	326.00
32	10" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$	486.00
33	12" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	4	\$	646.00
34	4" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	160.00
35	6" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	223.00
36	8" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	327.00
37	10" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	430.00
38	12" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	6	\$	573.00
39	6" compact MJ Swivel Adapt.	6	\$	232.00
40	4" compact MJ Plug	2	\$	30.00
41	6" compact MJ Plug	4	\$	57.00
42	8" compact MJ Plug	4	\$	84.00
43	10" compact MJ Plug	2	\$	145.00
44	12" compact MJ Plug	2	\$	258.00
45	4" compact MJ Cap	2	\$	95.00
46	6" compact MJ Cap	4	\$	140.00
47	8" compact MJ Cap	4	\$	210.00
48	10" compact MJ Cap	4	\$	278.00
49	12" compact MJ Cap	4	\$	393.00
			ENTER Unit Price Total Here ->	\$ 19,951.00
SECTION 3 - Valves & Hydrants				
1	4" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	4	\$	1,060.00
2	6" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	16	\$	1,310.00
3	8" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	12	\$	1,895.00
4	10" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	4	\$	2,781.00
5	12" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	6	\$	3,461.00
6	4" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	2	\$	1,165.00
7	6" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	2	\$	1,538.00
8	8" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	2	\$	2,160.00
9	10" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	2	\$	3,370.00
10	12" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	2	\$	4,910.00
11	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4' Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	6	\$	3,639.00
12	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	10	\$	3,750.00

13	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5' 0" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	20	\$	3,825.00
14	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	10	\$	3,900.00
15	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 6' Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	4	\$	4,300.00
16	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 6' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	2	\$	4,150.00
17	6" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	4	\$	585.00
18	12" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	4	\$	685.00
19	18" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	4	\$	775.00
20	24" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	4	\$	875.00
21	36" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	4	\$	1,240.00
22	6" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	8	\$	615.00
23	12" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	8	\$	760.00
24	24" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	4	\$	900.00
25	36" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	4	\$	1,245.00
26	6" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	8	\$	535.00
27	12" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	8	\$	620.00
28	24" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	4	\$	750.00
29	36" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	4	\$	1,300.00
30	Mueller 280359 Main Valve Repair Kit	10	\$	600.00
31	Mueller 280367 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved)	10	\$	900.00
32	Mueller 280366 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved)	10	\$	750.00
33	Mueller A301 Safety Flange Repair Kit	20	\$	290.00
34	Mueller A301-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved)	20	\$	290.00
35	Mueller A300-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved)	10	\$	260.00
36	Mueller 280355 Bonnet Repair Kit	4	\$	90.00
			ENTER Unit Price Total Here ->	\$ 18,215.00
SECTION 4 - Repair Clamps & Couplings				
1	4"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	8	\$	59.00
2	6"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	16	\$	68.00
3	8"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	12	\$	83.00
4	10"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	8	\$	101.00
5	12"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	10	\$	114.00
6	4"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	12	\$	96.00
7	6" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	24	\$	115.00
8	8" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	20	\$	135.00
9	10" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	12	\$	152.00
10	12" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	20	\$	178.00
11	4" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	115.00
12	6" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	12	\$	128.00
13	8" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	8	\$	158.00
14	10" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	197.00
15	12" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	8	\$	228.00
16	4" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	156.00
17	6" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	186.00

18	8" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	218.00
19	10" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	2	\$	265.00
20	12" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	300.00
21	4" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	87.00
22	6" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	98.00
23	8" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	110.00
24	10" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	2	\$	130.00
25	12" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	142.00
26	4" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	124.00
27	6" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	140.00
28	8" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	161.00
29	10" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	2	\$	185.00
30	12" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	210.00
31	4" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	87.00
32	6" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	98.00
33	8" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	110.00
34	10" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	2	\$	130.00
35	12" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	142.00
36	4" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	124.00
37	6" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	140.00
38	8" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	6	\$	161.00
39	10" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	2	\$	185.00
40	12" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	4	\$	210.00
41	4.80" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	325.00
42	6.90" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	348.00
43	6.90" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	461.00
44	9.05" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	375.00
45	9.05" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	490.00
46	11.10" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	400.00
47	11.10" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	575.00
48	13.20" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	462.00
49	13.20" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	2	\$	530.00
50	4" Hymax 2 Coupling	8	\$	200.00
51	6" Hymax 2 Coupling	24	\$	260.00
52	8" Hymax 2 Coupling	24	\$	295.00
53	10" Hymax 2 Coupling	8	\$	380.00
54	12" Hymax 2 Coupling	12	\$	395.00
55	4" X 6" Hymax 2 Reducer	4	\$	325.00
56	6" X 8" Hymax 2 Reducer	4	\$	370.00
57	8" X 10" Hymax 2 Reducer	4	\$	480.00
58	10" X 12" Hymax 2 Reducer	4	\$	510.00
59	4" Hymax Grip Coupling	4	\$	250.00
60	6" Hymax Grip Coupling	4	\$	340.00
61	8" Hymax Grip Coupling	4	\$	438.00
62	10" Hymax Grip Coupling	4	\$	550.00

63	12" Hymax Grip Coupling	4	\$	635.00
64	4" X 6" Hymax Grip Reducer	4	\$	485.00
65	6" X 8" Hymax Grip Reducer	4	\$	580.00
66	8" X 10" Hymax Grip Reducer	4	\$	725.00
67	10" X 12" Hymax Grip Reducer	4	\$	800.00
68	4" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint	2	\$	660.00
69	6" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint	2	\$	840.00
70	8" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint	2	\$	1,200.00
71	4" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve	4	\$	250.00
72	6" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve	4	\$	320.00
73	8" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve	4	\$	420.00
74	10" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve	4	\$	530.00
75	12" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve	4	\$	620.00
76	4" Hymax Grip End Cap	4	\$	170.00
77	6" Hymax Grip End Cap	4	\$	230.00
78	8" Hymax Grip End Cap	4	\$	320.00
79	10" Hymax Grip End Cap	4	\$	480.00
80	12" Hymax Grip End Cap	4	\$	535.00
81	6" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40")	8	\$	110.00
82	8" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40")	8	\$	135.00
83	10" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53")	4	\$	175.00
84	12" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55")	4	\$	210.00
85	6" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40")	6	\$	190.00
86	8" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40")	6	\$	210.00
87	10" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53")	4	\$	265.00
88	12" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55")	4	\$	320.00
89	6" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40")	4	\$	200.00
90	8" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40")	4	\$	240.00
91	10" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53")	4	\$	315.00
92	12" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55")	4	\$	370.00
93	6" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40")	4	\$	420.00
94	8" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40")	4	\$	510.00
95	10" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53")	4	\$	590.00
96	12" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55")	4	\$	650.00
97	6"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	668.00
98	8"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	745.00
99	10"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	810.00
100	12"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	870.00
101	8"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	1,075.00
102	10"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	1,320.00
103	12"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	1,540.00
104	10"X10" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	1,980.00
105	12"X10" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	1,945.00
106	12"X12" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	2	\$	2,099.00

			ENTER Unit Price Total Here ->	\$ 42,347.00
SECTION 5 - Water Service Parts				
1	3/4" Mueller H15008N Ground Key Corp Valve	24	\$	50.00
2	1" Mueller H15008N Ground Key Corp Valve	18	\$	74.00
3	1 1/2" Mueller H15013N Ori-Corp Corp Valve	8	\$	212.00
4	2" Mueller H15013N Ori-Corp Corp Valve	8	\$	350.00
5	3/4" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	24	\$	98.00
6	1" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	18	\$	165.00
7	1 1/2" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	8	\$	340.00
8	2" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	8	\$	505.00
9	3/4" Mueller H15403 Union	12	\$	30.00
10	1" Mueller H15403 Union	10	\$	32.00
11	1 1/2" H154303 Union	6	\$	110.00
12	2" Mueller H15403 Union	6	\$	143.00
13	3/4" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	12	\$	23.00
14	1" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	10	\$	27.00
15	1 1/2" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	6	\$	72.00
16	2" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	6	\$	104.00
17	3/4" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	12	\$	24.00
18	1" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	10	\$	33.00
19	1 1/2" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	6	\$	92.00
20	2" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	6	\$	108.00
21	3/4" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	12	\$	34.00
22	1" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	12	\$	42.00
23	1 1/2" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	6	\$	142.00
24	2" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	6	\$	285.00
25	3/4" Mueller H-15528 Compression Eighth Bend	6	\$	60.00
26	1" Mueller H-15528 Compression Eighth Bend	6	\$	72.00
27	3/4" Type K Copper Pipe (Price per Ft)	150	\$	7.50
28	1" Type K Copper Pipe (Price per Ft)	150	\$	12.00
29	1 1/2" Type K Copper (Price per Ft)	75	\$	17.00
30	2" Type K Copper (Price per Ft)	50	\$	25.00
31	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 1" 406-0663 X 09	5	\$	75.00
32	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 1" 406-0690 X 09	5	\$	75.00
33	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 1" 406-0745 X 09	5	\$	75.00
34	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0663 X 13	2	\$	89.00
35	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0690 X 13	2	\$	89.00
36	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0745 X 13	2	\$	89.00
37	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 2" 406-0663 X 15	2	\$	89.00
38	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 2" 406-0690 X 15	2	\$	89.00
39	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 2" 406-0745 X 15	2	\$	89.00
40	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 1" 406-0863 X 09	5	\$	104.00
41	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 1" 406-0905 X 09	5	\$	104.00

42	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 1" 406-0963 X 09	5	\$	104.00
43	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0863 X 13	2	\$	104.00
44	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0905 X 13	2	\$	104.00
45	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0963 X 13	2	\$	104.00
46	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 2" 406-0863 X 15	2	\$	104.00
47	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 2" 406-0905 X 15	2	\$	104.00
48	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 2" 406-0963 X 15	2	\$	106.00
49	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 1" 406-1075 X 09	2	\$	106.00
50	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 1" 406-1110 X 09	2	\$	106.00
51	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 1" 406-1140 X 09	2	\$	106.00
52	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 1" 406-1225 X 09	2	\$	106.00
53	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1075 X 13	2	\$	120.00
54	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1110 X 13	2	\$	120.00
55	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1140 X 13	2	\$	120.00
56	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1225 X 13	2	\$	120.00
57	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 2" 406-1075 X 15	2	\$	120.00
58	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 2" 406-1110 X 15	2	\$	120.00
59	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 2" 406-1140 X 15	2	\$	120.00
60	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 2" 406-1225 X 15	2	\$	120.00
61	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 1" 406-1320 X 09	2	\$	120.00
62	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 1" 406-1350 X 09	2	\$	120.00
63	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 1" 406-1426 X 09	2	\$	120.00
64	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1320 X 13	2	\$	140.00
65	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1350 X 13	2	\$	140.00
66	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1426 X 13	2	\$	140.00
67	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 2" 406-1320 X 15	2	\$	140.00
68	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 2" 406-1350 X 15	2	\$	140.00
69	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 2" 406-1426 X 15	2	\$	140.00
			ENTER Unit Price Total Here ->	\$ 7,569.50
SECTION 6 - Valve & Service Box Parts				
1	Bingham & Taylor Series 300 - P304 Adjustable 3" Plastic and Cast Iron Buffalo Curb Box (52" -58") w/ standard arch and old style water lid	60	\$	87.00
2	Bingham & Taylor Series 300 - P326 24" Extension	20	\$	17.00
3	Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Buffalo Curb Box (40"-60") w/ old style water lid	30	\$	130.00
4	Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Curb Box – Extension 151 – 9.5"	10	\$	30.00
5	Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Curb Box – Extension 152 – 16.5"	10	\$	36.00
6	CP Test - 253LMK1824 Adjustable 3" Cast Iron and Plastic Locking Curb Box (43"-57")	30	\$	53.00
7	New Style Buffalo Box Repair Lid	60	\$	36.00
8	Old Style Buffalo Box Repair Lid	60	\$	36.00
9	Mueller A802 Repair Lid for Mueller Extension Type Curb Box	5	\$	18.00
10	3-5' 2 Piece Screw Type Valve Box w/ Lid	12	\$	260.00
11	Valve Box Lids Marked "Water"	30	\$	27.00

12	Valve Box Lids Marked "Sewer"	6	\$	27.00
13	1" Paving Risers Less Lid	50	\$	20.00
14	1 1/2" Paving Risers Less Lid	50	\$	22.00
15	2" Paving Risers Less Lid	40	\$	24.00
16	3" Paving Risers Less Lid	30	\$	48.00
17	4" Paving Risers Less Lid	30	\$	48.00
18	Rite Hite Paving Risers Less Lid	30	\$	55.00
			ENTER Unit Price Total Here ->	\$ 974.00
SECTION 7 - Miscellaneous				
1	4' Mueller H10322 Curb Box Key	4	\$	77.00
2	6' Mueller H10322 Curb Box Key	4	\$	110.00
3	4' Shut-off Rod	4	\$	90.00
4	6' Shut-off Rod	4	\$	110.00
5	6' P525 Buffalo Box Cleaner	4	\$	130.00
6	6' P527 Valve Box Cleaner	4	\$	260.00
7	6' T-Handle Millennium Gate Valve Key w/3' Handle	2	\$	220.00
8	6' T-Handle Standard Gate Valve Key w/3' Handle	2	\$	110.00
9	Ratcheting Gate Valve key, 6' Solid Shaft w/ swivel 2" socket	2		\$300.00
10	4-way Multi-Wrench	4	\$	80.00
11	Harrington Permanent Hydrant Storz Adapter (or equivalent)	10	\$	260.00
12	Brass Cleanout Cap (2"Nut)	12	\$	17.00
13	Brass Cleanout Cap (Recessed)	12	\$	17.00
14	4' X 3/8" Fiberglass Shaft Hydrant Marker with Bonnet Mounting Hardware and Spring	50	\$	50.00
15	In-fact Foster Adaptor 4"	2	\$	95.00
16	In-fact Foster Adaptor 6"	20	\$	120.00
17	In-fact Foster Adaptor 8"	20	\$	170.00
18	In-fact Foster Adaptor 10"	5	\$	240.00
19	In-fact Foster Adaptor 12"	10	\$	260.00
20	In-fact Flex Adaptor, 6-inch MJ x MJ w/Accessories	5	\$	280.00
21	In-fact Valve Box Mud Plugs	25	\$	8.00
22	Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 4' Bury	3		\$1,200.00
23	Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 4.5' Bury	3		\$1,225.00
24	Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 5' Bury	3		\$1,280.00
			ENTER Unit Price Total Here ->	\$ 6,709.00
SECTION 8 - Sewer Treatment Plant Parts				
1	4" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve	4		NO BID
2	6" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve	4		NO BID
3	8" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve	4		NO BID
4	4" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket	10		NO BID
5	6" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket	10		NO BID
6	8" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket	10		NO BID
7	3/4" X 3" bolts with lock nuts	60		NO BID

8	3/4" heavy hex nut	60	NO BID
9	4" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel	4	NO BID
10	6" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel	4	NO BID
11	8" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel	4	NO BID
12	4" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel	4	NO BID
13	6" Victaulic Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel	4	NO BID
14	8" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel	4	NO BID
15	4" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve	4	NO BID
16	6" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve	4	NO BID
17	8" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve	4	NO BID
18	Mueller 2-1/8" Post Fire Hydrant A-411, one-way	4	NO BID

***Res 22-197 Authorizing the Execution of a Community Service Contribution Agreement Between Cooperman Barnabas Medical Center and the Township of Livingston**

WHEREAS, the Township of Livingston ("Township") has numerous pending tax appeals involving properties owned by Cooperman Barnabas Medical Center f/k/a Saint Barnabas Medical Center (CBMC) concerning the claimed exempt status of portions of CBMC's properties; and

WHEREAS, CBMC has contested and filed counterclaims in those appeals; and

WHEREAS, the Township is a party to a legal challenge to the recently enacted Public Law 2021, Chapter 17 which established the obligation of hospitals to pay Community Service Fees to their host municipalities in lieu of property taxes; and

WHEREAS, Public Law 2021, Chapter 17 authorizes hospitals and their host municipalities to enter into Voluntary Agreements on terms exceeding the minimum Community Service Fee; and

WHEREAS, the Township's Special Counsel for the CBMC Tax Appeals and legal challenge to Public Law 2021, Chapter 17, together with the Township Manger have negotiated and recommended the approval of a Community Service Contribution Agreement with CBMC to settle all of the pending tax appeals, counterclaims and the Township's withdrawal from the legal challenge to Public Law 2021, Chapter 17; and

WHEREAS, the Township Council, having reviewed the terms of the Community Service Contribution Agreement, has determined that it is in the best interests of the Township and its taxpayers and residents to approve the Agreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Township Council of the Township of Livingston, in the County of Essex, State of New Jersey, that Community Service Contribution Agreement by and between the Township of Livingston and Cooperman Barnabas Medical Center is hereby approved and the Township Manager is hereby it authorized to execute and enter into the Community Service Contribution Agreement and any additional or ancillary documents in connection therewith, and Special Counsel is authorized and directed to make all necessary filings in the Tax Court of New Jersey and the Superior Court of New Jersey to effectuate and fulfill the Township's obligations under the Agreement.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on roll call vote, all members present voting YES, Resolutions 22-188 through Resolutions 22-197 was adopted.

	Yes	No	Abstain
Ed Meinhardt	X		
Michael Vieira	X		
Al Anthony	X		
Rudy Fernandez	X		
Shawn Klein	X		

Comcast Hearing: Evaluating the Application of Comcast of New Jersey, II, LLC for the Renewal of its Municipal Consent to Own, Operate, Extend, and Maintain a Cable Television and Cable Communications System in the Township of Livingston. Township Manager Lewis stated that Federal law governs cable franchises in municipalities, and that the Township is continuing to review their contract with Comcast. On motion made and duly seconded, and on voice vote, the hearing will be carried to the July 25, 2022 Township Council meeting.

Q. Public Portion (on any subject—3 minute time limit)

On motion duly made and seconded, and on voice vote, the public portion was opened.

Township Clerk Mazzucco read comments from Matthew Boxer, 6 Trombley Drive, regarding stormwater drainage in the Township.

On motion duly made and seconded, and on voice vote, the public portion was closed.

At 8:58 p.m., the Regular meeting was adjourned.

EDWARD MEINHARDT, Mayor

CAROLYN MAZZUCCO, RMC Township Clerk