

Township of Livingston
 BID 010-2021 - Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 BID ABSTRACT
 Bid Opening - July 7, 2021 - 11:00AM
 Prepared By: Nathan Kiracofe, Utility Engineer

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.	Atlantic Plumbing Supply	Capitol Supply Construction Inc	Raritan Group Inc.	Core & Main
190 Oberlin Ave, Lakewood, NJ 08701	702 Joline Ave, Longbranch, NJ 07740	149 Old Turnpike Road, Wayne, NJ 07470	PO Box 10120, New Brunswick, NJ 08906	660 State Highway 23, PO Box 306, Pompton Plains, NJ 07444

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
SECTION 1 - Pipe						
1	4" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$ 25.82	\$ 28.11	\$ 31.38	No Bid	\$ 26.43
2	6" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$ 19.85	\$ 21.59	\$ 24.10		\$ 21.43
3	8" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$ 27.99	\$ 30.47	\$ 34.01		\$ 30.24
4	10" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$ 36.70	\$ 39.95	\$ 44.59		\$ 37.55
5	12" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$ 46.21	\$ 50.29	\$ 56.14		\$ 47.28
6	16" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$ 66.87	\$ 72.77	\$ 81.23		\$ 68.41
	Total	\$ 223.44	\$ 243.18	\$ 271.45	No Bid	\$ 231.34
SECTION 2 - Fittings						
1	6" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 268.52	\$ 239.77	\$ 277.65	\$ 403.84	\$ 295.04
2	8" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 364.90	\$ 371.70	\$ 398.88	\$ 499.33	\$ 365.66
3	8" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 418.49	\$ 426.29	\$ 457.99	\$ 567.64	\$ 419.37
4	10" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 530.10	\$ 539.86	\$ 580.74	\$ 712.49	\$ 531.09
5	10" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 602.28	\$ 613.50	\$ 660.79	\$ 801.73	\$ 603.54
6	12" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 649.61	\$ 661.70	\$ 711.44	\$ 876.76	\$ 650.96
7	12" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 685.93	\$ 698.70	\$ 751.21	\$ 925.72	\$ 687.36
8	12" X 10" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 607.83	\$ 833.72	\$ 898.14	\$ 1,088.30	\$ 820.18
9	12" X 12" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 599.29	\$ 885.48	\$ 953.42	\$ 1,160.37	\$ 871.10
10	6" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 236.78	\$ 326.30	\$ 306.66	\$ 432.91	\$ 321.00
11	8" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 326.76	\$ 403.95	\$ 390.21	\$ 486.84	\$ 397.39
12	10" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 694.22	\$ 452.64	\$ 594.64	\$ 770.51	\$ 583.01
13	12" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 694.22	\$ 707.05	\$ 717.27	\$ 926.72	\$ 695.66
14	4" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 120.25	\$ 122.50	\$ 130.45	\$ 173.86	\$ 120.51
15	6" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 174.22	\$ 177.46	\$ 189.80	\$ 244.51	\$ 174.58
16	8" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 233.90	\$ 238.26	\$ 254.82	\$ 327.92	\$ 234.39
17	10" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 342.74	\$ 365.38	\$ 391.56	\$ 495.95	\$ 359.44
18	12" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 463.63	\$ 494.55	\$ 530.31	\$ 668.28	\$ 486.52
19	4" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 126.01	\$ 128.36	\$ 136.89	\$ 180.31	\$ 126.27
20	6" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 171.34	\$ 174.53	\$ 186.58	\$ 241.29	\$ 171.69
21	8" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 267.68	\$ 249.99	\$ 267.71	\$ 340.82	\$ 245.93
22	10" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 350.07	\$ 356.58	\$ 381.88	\$ 486.28	\$ 350.79
23	12" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 500.62	\$ 509.95	\$ 547.24	\$ 685.20	\$ 501.66
24	4" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 128.16	\$ 130.56	\$ 138.46	\$ 182.72	\$ 128.43
25	6" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 180.17	\$ 183.33	\$ 196.25	\$ 250.96	\$ 180.35
26	8" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 248.29	\$ 252.92	\$ 270.94	\$ 344.04	\$ 248.81
27	10" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 356.53	\$ 363.17	\$ 389.13	\$ 493.52	\$ 357.27
28	12" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 552.43	\$ 562.72	\$ 605.26	\$ 743.23	\$ 553.57
29	4" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 140.40	\$ 143.02	\$ 153.00	\$ 196.43	\$ 140.69
30	6" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 200.85	\$ 204.59	\$ 219.62	\$ 274.33	\$ 201.26
31	8" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 282.83	\$ 288.10	\$ 309.62	\$ 382.72	\$ 283.42
32	10" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 456.56	\$ 465.06	\$ 501.16	\$ 605.55	\$ 457.50
33	12" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 641.44	\$ 652.87	\$ 704.38	\$ 842.35	\$ 642.26
34	4" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 135.36	\$ 137.89	\$ 147.36	\$ 190.78	\$ 135.64
35	6" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 186.46	\$ 189.93	\$ 203.51	\$ 258.22	\$ 186.84
36	8" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 245.41	\$ 249.99	\$ 267.71	\$ 340.82	\$ 245.92
37	10" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 359.41	\$ 366.11	\$ 392.36	\$ 496.75	\$ 360.15
38	12" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$ 480.47	\$ 489.42	\$ 524.67	\$ 662.64	\$ 481.47
39	6" compact MJ Swivel Adapt.	\$ 136.71	\$ 224.37	\$ 132.01	\$ 153.12	\$ 220.73
40	4" compact MJ Plug	\$ 44.61	\$ 79.21	\$ 49.96	\$ 49.97	\$ 77.92
41	6" compact MJ Plug	\$ 70.52	\$ 114.39	\$ 78.98	\$ 78.98	\$ 112.52
42	8" compact MJ Plug	\$ 100.02	\$ 158.72	\$ 112.02	\$ 112.03	\$ 156.13
43	10" compact MJ Plug	\$ 128.81	\$ 212.38	\$ 144.26	\$ 144.26	\$ 208.92
44	12" compact MJ Plug	\$ 153.98	\$ 264.13	\$ 172.46	\$ 175.96	\$ 259.84
45	4" compact MJ Cap	\$ 35.27	\$ 69.68	\$ 39.49	\$ 39.50	\$ 68.54
46	6" compact MJ Cap	\$ 46.78	\$ 90.21	\$ 52.39	\$ 52.39	\$ 88.73
47	8" compact MJ Cap	\$ 73.39	\$ 131.59	\$ 82.20	\$ 82.20	\$ 129.45
48	10" compact MJ Cap	\$ 107.22	\$ 190.39	\$ 120.08	\$ 120.09	\$ 187.29
49	12" compact MJ Cap	\$ 136.71	\$ 246.54	\$ 153.12	\$ 153.12	\$ 242.53
	Total	\$ 15,058.18	\$ 16,439.51	\$ 16,876.68	\$ 20,924.26	\$ 16,369.32
SECTION 3 - Valves						
1	4" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$ 786.37	\$ 669.24	\$ 798.93	\$ 886.31	\$ 764.93
2	6" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$ 916.25	\$ 806.00	\$ 961.18	\$ 1,075.24	\$ 928.44
3	8" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$ 1,335.54	\$ 1,158.81	\$ 1,387.76	\$ 1,560.50	\$ 1,355.79
4	10" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$ 1,971.30	\$ 1,694.95	\$ 2,034.27	\$ 2,299.42	\$ 1,963.49
5	12" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$ 2,457.60	\$ 2,108.66	\$ 2,527.86	\$ 2,873.36	\$ 2,473.86
6	4" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$ 825.47	\$ 714.10	\$ 905.40	\$ 980.91	\$ 821.06

Township of Livingston
 BID 010-2021 - Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 BID ABSTRACT
 Bid Opening - July 7, 2021 - 11:00AM
 Prepared By: Nathan Kiracofe, Utility Engineer

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.	Atlantic Plumbing Supply	Capitol Supply Construction Inc	Raritan Group Inc.	Core & Main
190 Oberlin Ave, Lakewood, NJ 08701	702 Joline Ave, Longbranch, NJ 07740	149 Old Turnpike Road, Wayne, NJ 07470	PO Box 10120, New Brunswick, NJ 08906	660 State Highway 23, PO Box 306, Pompton Plains, NJ 07444

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
7	6" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$ 1,094.44	\$ 936.10	\$ 1,188.44	\$ 1,296.30	\$ 1,090.51
8	8" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$ 1,540.92	\$ 1,307.10	\$ 1,657.98	\$ 1,819.29	\$ 1,530.15
9	10" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$ 2,236.18	\$ 1,883.10	\$ 2,391.13	\$ 2,637.23	\$ 2,235.69
10	12" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$ 3,289.73	\$ 2,754.88	\$ 3,491.98	\$ 3,858.59	\$ 3,291.65
	Total	\$ 16,453.80	\$ 14,032.94	\$ 17,344.93	\$ 19,287.15	\$ 16,455.57
	SECTION 4 - Hydrants					
1	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4' Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	\$ 2,935.83	No Bid	\$ 2,848.86	\$ 3,139.19	No Bid
2	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	\$ 2,993.22		\$ 2,997.97	\$ 3,201.45	
3	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5' 0" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	\$ 3,050.77		\$ 2,960.42	\$ 3,263.99	
4	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	\$ 3,108.24		\$ 3,016.19	\$ 3,326.22	
5	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 6' Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	\$ 3,165.63		\$ 3,071.89	\$ 3,388.46	
6	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 6' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle	\$ 3,230.13		\$ 3,309.22	\$ 3,450.96	
7	6" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$ 471.18		\$ 482.70	\$ 543.04	
8	12" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$ 554.05		\$ 567.59	\$ 638.54	
9	18" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$ 627.27		\$ 642.60	\$ 722.93	
10	24" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$ 705.58		\$ 722.82	\$ 813.18	
11	36" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$ 1,105.61		\$ 1,132.63	\$ 1,274.22	
12	6" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 471.18		\$ 482.70	\$ 543.04	
13	12" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 554.08		\$ 567.59	\$ 638.54	
14	24" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 705.58		\$ 722.82	\$ 813.18	
15	36" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 1,105.61		\$ 1,132.63	\$ 1,274.22	
16	6" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 428.42		\$ 438.89	\$ 493.75	
17	12" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 497.38		\$ 510.64	\$ 574.48	
18	24" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 602.57		\$ 617.30	\$ 694.47	
19	36" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$ 1,048.86		\$ 1,074.50	\$ 1,208.82	
20	Mueller 280359 Main Valve Repair Kit	\$ 486.42		\$ 498.31	\$ 560.60	
21	Mueller 280367 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved)	\$ 710.46		\$ 727.82	\$ 818.80	
22	Mueller 280366 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved)	\$ 601.63		\$ 616.33	\$ 693.38	
23	Mueller A301 Safety Flange Repair Kit	\$ 206.61		\$ 211.66	\$ 238.12	
24	Mueller A301-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved)	\$ 206.61		\$ 211.66	\$ 238.12	
25	Mueller A300-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved)	\$ 206.61		\$ 211.66	\$ 238.12	
26	Mueller 280355 Bonnet Repair Kit	\$ 74.33		\$ 76.14	\$ 85.67	
	Total	\$ 29,853.86	No Bid	\$ 29,853.54	\$ 32,875.49	No Bid
	SECTION 5 - Repair Clamps & Couplings					
1	4"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 47.72	\$ 54.43	\$ 57.60	No Bid	\$ 49.97
2	6"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 55.48	\$ 64.24	\$ 67.98		\$ 58.10
3	8"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 63.84	\$ 76.84	\$ 81.32		\$ 66.85
4	10"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 74.33	\$ 93.53	\$ 98.98		\$ 77.83
5	12"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 74.66	\$ 105.50	\$ 111.64		\$ 78.18
6	4"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 67.66	\$ 89.19	\$ 94.39		\$ 70.85
7	6" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 80.44	\$ 102.74	\$ 108.72		\$ 84.23
8	8" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 93.98	\$ 123.05	\$ 130.21		\$ 98.40
9	10" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 104.09	\$ 145.28	\$ 153.74		\$ 108.99
10	12" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 107.79	\$ 169.78	\$ 179.67		\$ 112.86
11	4" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 90.07	\$ 107.61	\$ 113.87		\$ 94.31
12	6" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 103.78	\$ 119.39	\$ 126.34		\$ 108.66
13	8" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 122.18	\$ 123.05	\$ 130.21		\$ 127.93
14	10" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 138.50	\$ 183.09	\$ 193.75		\$ 145.02
15	12" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 145.42	\$ 210.99	\$ 223.26		\$ 152.26
16	4" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 124.69	\$ 144.52	\$ 152.93		\$ 130.56
17	6" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 141.84	\$ 173.00	\$ 183.07		\$ 148.52
18	8" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 167.03	\$ 203.14	\$ 214.96		\$ 174.90
19	10" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 191.62	\$ 244.80	\$ 259.05		\$ 200.64
20	12" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 203.02	\$ 278.65	\$ 294.87		\$ 212.58
21	4" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 61.45	\$ 80.44	\$ 85.12		\$ 64.35
22	6" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 73.52	\$ 90.24	\$ 95.49		\$ 76.98
23	8" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 82.93	\$ 102.86	\$ 108.85		\$ 86.84
24	10" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 87.79	\$ 135.30	\$ 143.18		\$ 91.92
25	12" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 88.14	\$ 149.11	\$ 157.79		\$ 92.29
26	4" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 84.21	\$ 115.20	\$ 121.91		\$ 88.18
27	6" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 97.43	\$ 128.76	\$ 136.25		\$ 102.02
28	8" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 110.36	\$ 149.05	\$ 157.73		\$ 115.56
29	10" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 120.47	\$ 171.29	\$ 181.26		\$ 126.15
30	12" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 127.12	\$ 195.79	\$ 207.19		\$ 133.11
31	4" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 61.45	\$ 80.44	\$ 85.12		\$ 64.35
32	6" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 73.52	\$ 90.24	\$ 95.49		\$ 76.98
33	8" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 82.93	\$ 102.86	\$ 108.85		\$ 86.84

Township of Livingston
 BID 010-2021 - Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 BID ABSTRACT
 Bid Opening - July 7, 2021 - 11:00AM
 Prepared By: Nathan Kiracofe, Utility Engineer

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.	Atlantic Plumbing Supply	Capitol Supply Construction Inc	Raritan Group Inc.	Core & Main
190 Oberlin Ave, Lakewood, NJ 08701	702 Joline Ave, Longbranch, NJ 07740	149 Old Turnpike Road, Wayne, NJ 07470	PO Box 10120, New Brunswick, NJ 08906	660 State Highway 23, PO Box 306, Pompton Plains, NJ 07444

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
34	10" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 87.79	\$ 119.54	\$ 126.49		\$ 91.92
35	12" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 88.14	\$ 131.50	\$ 139.15		\$ 92.29
36	4" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 84.21	\$ 115.20	\$ 121.91		\$ 88.18
37	6" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 97.43	\$ 128.76	\$ 136.25		\$ 102.02
38	8" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 110.36	\$ 149.05	\$ 157.73		\$ 115.56
39	10" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 120.47	\$ 171.29	\$ 181.26		\$ 126.15
40	12" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$ 127.12	\$ 195.79	\$ 207.19		\$ 133.11
41	4.80" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 242.87	\$ 586.42	\$ 1,032.86		\$ 254.72
42	6.90" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 254.95	\$ 591.87	\$ 1,035.71		\$ 266.95
43	6.90" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 329.24	\$ 610.40	\$ 1,093.57		\$ 344.73
44	9.05" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 268.85	\$ 618.03	\$ 1,129.29		\$ 281.50
45	9.05" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 343.51	\$ 667.08	\$ 1,173.57		\$ 359.68
46	11.10" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 281.33	\$ 705.23	\$ 1,297.14		\$ 294.57
47	11.10" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 355.01	\$ 763.00	\$ 1,294.29		\$ 371.72
48	13.20" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 308.77	\$ 795.70	\$ 1,364.29		\$ 323.30
49	13.20" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve	\$ 378.28	\$ 881.81	\$ 1,401.43		\$ 395.73
50	4" Hymax 2 Coupling	\$ 159.66	\$ 185.72	\$ 178.82		\$ 158.40
51	6" Hymax 2 Coupling	\$ 211.45	\$ 245.22	\$ 236.82		\$ 234.45
52	8" Hymax 2 Coupling	\$ 238.73	\$ 277.72	\$ 267.38		\$ 264.71
53	10" Hymax 2 Coupling	\$ 307.11	\$ 384.54	\$ 363.69		\$ 322.15
54	12" Hymax 2 Coupling	\$ 362.50	\$ 513.89	\$ 406.00		\$ 359.63
55	4" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint	\$ 623.24	\$ 708.73	\$ 698.01		\$ 620.38
56	6" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint	\$ 796.77	\$ 775.07	\$ 892.36		\$ 834.37
57	8" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint	\$ 1,141.87	\$ 826.35	\$ 1,278.89		\$ 1,195.77
58	6" X 4" Hymax 2 Reducer	\$ 269.41	\$ 862.88	\$ 301.73		\$ 267.28
59	8" X 6" Hymax 2 Reducer	\$ 311.63	\$ 332.36	\$ 349.01		\$ 309.16
60	10" X 8" Hymax 2 Reducer	\$ 403.87	\$ 419.07	\$ 452.33		\$ 400.67
61	12" X 10" Hymax 2 Reducer	\$ 438.92	\$ 530.32	\$ 572.40		\$ 435.45
62	4" Hymax Grip Coupling	\$ 201.37	\$ 208.95	\$ 225.53		\$ 199.77
63	6" Hymax Grip Coupling	\$ 277.34	\$ 287.79	\$ 310.62		\$ 275.14
64	8" Hymax Grip Coupling	\$ 358.21	\$ 371.70	\$ 401.19		\$ 355.37
65	10" Hymax Grip Coupling	\$ 454.70	\$ 471.82	\$ 509.26		\$ 451.10
66	12" Hymax Grip Coupling	\$ 535.33	\$ 555.49	\$ 599.56		\$ 531.09
67	6" x 9" Hymax Clamp	\$ 106.84	\$ 110.86	\$ 119.66		\$ 105.99
68	8" x 9" Hymax Clamp	\$ 125.53	\$ 130.25	\$ 140.59		\$ 124.53
69	10" x 9" Hymax Clamp	\$ 160.23	\$ 166.26	\$ 179.45		\$ 158.96
70	12" x 9" Hymax Clamp	\$ 189.59	\$ 196.73	\$ 212.34		\$ 188.09
71	6" x 12" Hymax Clamp	\$ 169.26	\$ 176.72	\$ 190.73		\$ 168.95
72	8" x 12" Hymax Clamp	\$ 196.64	\$ 204.04	\$ 220.22		\$ 195.08
73	10" x 12" Hymax Clamp	\$ 250.81	\$ 260.25	\$ 280.91		\$ 248.82
74	12" x 12" Hymax Clamp	\$ 303.66	\$ 315.09	\$ 340.09		\$ 301.26
75	6" x 15" Hymax Clamp	\$ 187.36	\$ 194.41	\$ 210.20		\$ 185.88
76	8" x 15" Hymax Clamp	\$ 226.03	\$ 234.54	\$ 253.15		\$ 224.25
77	10" x 15" Hymax Clamp	\$ 291.07	\$ 302.03	\$ 326.00		\$ 288.77
78	12" x 15" Hymax Clamp	\$ 345.42	\$ 358.43	\$ 386.86		\$ 342.68
79	6" x 24" Hymax Clamp	\$ 402.74	\$ 417.91	\$ 451.07		\$ 399.56
80	8" x 24" Hymax Clamp	\$ 487.02	\$ 505.36	\$ 545.46		\$ 483.16
81	10" x 24" Hymax Clamp	\$ 563.31	\$ 584.53	\$ 630.91		\$ 558.86
82	12" x 24" Hymax Clamp	\$ 620.68	\$ 644.06	\$ 695.15		\$ 615.76
83	6"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 654.10	\$ 708.73	\$ 796.84		\$ 684.89
84	8"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 702.20	\$ 775.07	\$ 871.43		\$ 735.25
85	10"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 799.18	\$ 826.35	\$ 929.06		\$ 836.79
86	12"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 879.07	\$ 862.88	\$ 970.15		\$ 920.44
87	8"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 973.98	\$ 992.27	\$ 1,115.61		\$ 1,019.82
88	10"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 991.01	\$ 1,230.62	\$ 1,182.23		\$ 1,037.65
89	12"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 1,081.88	\$ 1,230.62	\$ 809.04		\$ 1,132.79
90	10"X10" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 1,438.08	\$ 719.58	\$ 1,383.59		\$ 1,505.76
91	12"X10" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 1,411.80	\$ 1,320.96	\$ 1,485.16		\$ 1,478.24
92	12"X12" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$ 1,657.31	\$ 1,566.94	\$ 1,761.71		\$ 1,735.30
	Total	\$ 29,134.70	\$ 34,628.18	\$ 41,084.13	No Bid	\$ 30,041.76
	SECTION 6 - Water Service Parts					
1	3/4" Mueller H15008N Ground Key Corp Valve	\$ 35.72	\$ 36.87	\$ 37.34	\$ 38.66	\$ 31.67
2	1" Mueller H15008N Ground Key Corp Valve	\$ 54.09	\$ 55.77	\$ 56.55	\$ 58.55	\$ 47.90
3	1 1/2" Mueller H15013N Ori-Corp Corp Valve	\$ 158.42	\$ 160.76	\$ 165.63	\$ 171.48	\$ 135.22
4	2" Mueller H15013N Ori-Corp Corp Valve	\$ 262.08	\$ 265.89	\$ 273.99	\$ 283.66	\$ 228.36
5	3/4" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	\$ 73.12	\$ 74.67	\$ 76.44	\$ 79.15	\$ 56.91
6	1" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	\$ 120.85	\$ 112.23	\$ 126.36	\$ 130.80	\$ 87.86

Township of Livingston
 BID 010-2021 - Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 BID ABSTRACT
 Bid Opening - July 7, 2021 - 11:00AM
 Prepared By: Nathan Kiracofe, Utility Engineer

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.	Atlantic Plumbing Supply	Capitol Supply Construction Inc	Raritan Group Inc.	Core & Main
190 Oberlin Ave, Lakewood, NJ 08701	702 Joline Ave, Longbranch, NJ 07740	149 Old Turnpike Road, Wayne, NJ 07470	PO Box 10120, New Brunswick, NJ 08906	660 State Highway 23, PO Box 306, Pompton Plains, NJ 07444

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
7	1 1/2" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	\$ 254.09	\$ 268.59	\$ 265.64	\$ 275.02	\$ 225.93
8	2" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop	\$ 376.13	\$ 377.59	\$ 393.23	\$ 407.11	\$ 324.31
9	3/4" Mueller H15403 Union	\$ 19.96	\$ 20.57	\$ 20.86	\$ 21.60	\$ 17.69
10	1" Mueller H15403 Union	\$ 21.77	\$ 23.54	\$ 22.76	\$ 23.57	\$ 20.23
11	1 1/2" H154303 Union	\$ 76.75	\$ 78.77	\$ 80.24	\$ 83.08	\$ 66.28
12	2" Mueller H15403 Union	\$ 103.66	\$ 106.38	\$ 108.38	\$ 112.20	\$ 91.35
13	3/4" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	\$ 16.36	\$ 16.90	\$ 17.10	\$ 17.71	\$ 14.22
14	1" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	\$ 19.33	\$ 20.02	\$ 20.20	\$ 20.92	\$ 16.84
15	1 1/2" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	\$ 53.44	\$ 54.83	\$ 55.86	\$ 57.84	\$ 46.13
16	2" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter	\$ 77.85	\$ 79.89	\$ 81.39	\$ 84.26	\$ 67.21
17	3/4" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	\$ 17.52	\$ 17.77	\$ 18.32	\$ 18.97	\$ 15.28
18	1" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	\$ 25.07	\$ 24.11	\$ 26.20	\$ 27.13	\$ 20.29
19	1 1/2" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	\$ 34.16	\$ 70.16	\$ 35.72	\$ 36.98	\$ 58.99
20	2" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter	\$ 81.42	\$ 83.50	\$ 85.13	\$ 88.13	\$ 70.25
21	3/4" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	\$ 24.52	\$ 26.58	\$ 25.64	\$ 26.55	\$ 22.86
22	1" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	\$ 31.49	\$ 34.20	\$ 32.92	\$ 34.09	\$ 29.35
23	1 1/2" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	\$ 106.94	\$ 109.73	\$ 111.80	\$ 115.75	\$ 92.30
24	2" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend	\$ 216.36	\$ 222.01	\$ 226.19	\$ 234.18	\$ 190.67
25	3/4" Mueller H-15528 Compression Eighth Bend	\$ 45.11	\$ 29.98	\$ 47.16	\$ 48.83	\$ 25.75
26	1" Mueller H-15528 Compression Eighth Bend	\$ 54.19	\$ 52.03	\$ 56.65	\$ 58.65	\$ 44.69
27	3/4" X 3/4" Mueller H15381N Service Tee	\$ 45.48	\$ 49.83	\$ 47.95	\$ 49.65	\$ 42.78
28	3/4" X 1" Mueller H15381N Service Tee	\$ 41.84	\$ 53.08	\$ 51.14	\$ 52.95	\$ 45.58
29	3/4" X 1-1/2" Mueller H15381N Service Tee	\$ 109.27	\$ 112.60	\$ 111.70	\$ 115.65	\$ 76.92
30	3/4" X 2" Mueller H15381N Service Tee	\$ 224.11	\$ 142.96	\$ 291.45	\$ 301.75	\$ 143.09
31	1" X 1-1/2" Mueller H15381N Service Tee	\$ 106.85	\$ 102.60	\$ 111.70	\$ 115.65	\$ 90.84
32	1" X 2" Mueller H15381N Service Tee	\$ 278.79	\$ 142.96	\$ 291.45	\$ 301.75	\$ 163.53
33	3/4" Type K Copper Pipe (Price per Ft)	\$ 5.89	\$ 6.04	\$ 7.69	\$ 10.50	\$ 8.28
34	1" Type K Copper Pipe (Price per Ft)	\$ 26.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 10.20	\$ 13.92	\$ 10.99
35	1 1/2" Type K Copper (Price per Ft)	\$ 30.48	\$ 12.49	\$ 15.51	\$ 21.72	\$ 20.85
36	2" Type K Copper (Price per Ft)	\$ 48.47	\$ 19.86	\$ 25.30	\$ 34.54	\$ 27.25
37	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 1" 406-0663 X 09	\$ 59.16	\$ 57.20	\$ 70.24	\$ 74.29	\$ 54.74
38	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 1" 406-0690 X 09	\$ 59.16	\$ 57.20	\$ 70.24	\$ 74.29	\$ 54.74
39	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 1" 406-0745 X 09	\$ 59.16	\$ 57.20	\$ 70.24	\$ 74.29	\$ 54.74
40	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0663 X 13	\$ 70.89	\$ 67.10	\$ 76.29	\$ 87.15	\$ 64.22
41	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0690 X 13	\$ 70.89	\$ 67.10	\$ 76.29	\$ 87.15	\$ 64.22
42	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0745 X 13	\$ 70.89	\$ 67.10	\$ 76.29	\$ 87.15	\$ 64.22
43	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 2" 406-0663 X 15	\$ 70.89	\$ 67.10	\$ 84.19	\$ 87.15	\$ 64.22
44	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 2" 406-0690 X 15	\$ 70.89	\$ 67.10	\$ 84.19	\$ 87.15	\$ 64.22
45	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 2" 406-0745 X 15	\$ 70.89	\$ 40.70	\$ 87.06	\$ 52.86	\$ 64.22
46	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 1" 406-0863 X 09	\$ 69.96	\$ 68.20	\$ 81.67	\$ 88.58	\$ 65.27
47	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 1" 406-0905 X 09	\$ 69.96	\$ 68.20	\$ 81.67	\$ 88.58	\$ 65.27
48	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 1" 406-0963 X 09	\$ 69.96	\$ 68.20	\$ 82.99	\$ 88.58	\$ 65.27
49	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0863 X 13	\$ 82.54	\$ 77.00	\$ 87.06	\$ 100.00	\$ 73.69
50	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0905 X 13	\$ 82.54	\$ 79.20	\$ 87.06	\$ 102.86	\$ 75.79
51	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0963 X 13	\$ 82.54	\$ 79.20	\$ 89.80	\$ 102.86	\$ 75.79
52	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 2" 406-0863 X 15	\$ 76.84	\$ 77.00	\$ 94.69	\$ 100.00	\$ 73.69
53	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 2" 406-0905 X 15	\$ 76.84	\$ 79.20	\$ 94.69	\$ 102.86	\$ 75.79
54	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 2" 406-0963 X 15	\$ 76.84	\$ 79.20	\$ 94.69	\$ 102.86	\$ 75.79
55	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 1" 406-1075 X 09	\$ 89.12	\$ 80.30	\$ 98.63	\$ 104.29	\$ 76.85
56	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 1" 406-1110 X 09	\$ 89.12	\$ 80.30	\$ 98.63	\$ 104.29	\$ 76.85
57	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 1" 406-1140 X 09	\$ 89.12	\$ 80.30	\$ 98.63	\$ 104.29	\$ 76.85
58	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 1" 406-1225 X 09	\$ 89.12	\$ 80.30	\$ 98.63	\$ 117.15	\$ 76.85
59	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1075 X 13	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 106.11	\$ 117.15	\$ 86.32
60	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1110 X 13	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 106.11	\$ 117.15	\$ 86.32
61	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1140 X 13	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 106.11	\$ 117.15	\$ 86.32
62	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1225 X 13	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 106.11	\$ 117.15	\$ 86.32
63	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 2" 406-1075 X 15	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 114.41	\$ 117.15	\$ 86.32
64	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 2" 406-1110 X 15	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 114.41	\$ 117.15	\$ 86.32
65	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 2" 406-1140 X 15	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 114.41	\$ 117.15	\$ 86.32
66	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 2" 406-1225 X 15	\$ 89.12	\$ 90.20	\$ 114.41	\$ 120.00	\$ 86.32
67	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 1" 406-1320 X 09	\$ 89.12	\$ 92.40	\$ 114.79	\$ 120.00	\$ 88.43
68	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 1" 406-1350 X 09	\$ 89.12	\$ 92.40	\$ 114.79	\$ 120.00	\$ 88.43
69	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 1" 406-1426 X 09	\$ 89.12	\$ 92.40	\$ 114.79	\$ 134.29	\$ 88.43
70	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1320 X 13	\$ 102.45	\$ 103.40	\$ 122.94	\$ 134.29	\$ 98.95
71	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1350 X 13	\$ 102.45	\$ 103.40	\$ 122.94	\$ 134.29	\$ 98.95
72	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1426 X 13	\$ 102.45	\$ 103.40	\$ 122.94	\$ 134.29	\$ 98.95
73	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 2" 406-1320 X 15	\$ 102.45	\$ 103.40	\$ 131.51	\$ 134.29	\$ 98.95
74	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 2" 406-1350 X 15	\$ 102.45	\$ 103.40	\$ 131.51	\$ 134.29	\$ 98.95

Township of Livingston
 BID 010-2021 - Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 BID ABSTRACT
 Bid Opening - July 7, 2021 - 11:00AM
 Prepared By: Nathan Kiracofe, Utility Engineer

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.	Atlantic Plumbing Supply	Capitol Supply Construction Inc	Raritan Group Inc.	Core & Main
190 Oberlin Ave, Lakewood, NJ 08701	702 Joline Ave, Longbranch, NJ 07740	149 Old Turnpike Road, Wayne, NJ 07470	PO Box 10120, New Brunswick, NJ 08906	660 State Highway 23, PO Box 306, Pompton Plains, NJ 07444

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
75	JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 2" 406-1426 X 15	\$ 102.45	\$ 103.40	\$ 131.51	\$ 134.29	\$ 98.95
	Total	\$ 6,507.64	\$ 6,237.36	\$ 7,305.46	\$ 7,711.71	\$ 5,731.49
SECTION 7 - Valve & Service Box Parts						
1	Bingham & Taylor Series 300 - P304 Adjustable 3" Plastic and Cast Iron Buffalo Curb Box (52" -58") w/ standard arch and old style water lid	\$ 61.71	\$ 62.62	\$ 75.81	No Bid	\$ 62.44
2	Bingham & Taylor Series 300 - P326 24" Extension	\$ 12.45	\$ 12.64	\$ 15.30		\$ 12.61
3	Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Buffalo Curb Box (40"-60") w/ old style water lid	\$ 91.95	\$ 93.34	\$ 112.97		\$ 93.04
4	Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Curb Box – Extension 151 – 9.5"	\$ 21.13	\$ 21.45	\$ 25.90		\$ 21.38
5	Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Curb Box – Extension 152 –	\$ 26.42	\$ 26.81	\$ 32.46		\$ 26.73
6	CP Test - 253LMK1824 Adjustable 3" Cast Iron and Plastic Locking Curb Box (43"-57")	\$ 39.35	\$ 39.94	\$ 67.68		\$ 42.09
7	New Style Buffalo Box Repair Lid	\$ 26.27	\$ 26.66	\$ 32.27		\$ 28.24
8	Old Style Buffalo Box Repair Lid	\$ 26.27	\$ 26.66	\$ 32.27		\$ 28.24
9	Mueller A802 Repair Lid for Mueller Extension Type Curb Box	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.96	\$ 21.76		\$ 8.38
10	3-5' 2 Piece Screw Type Valve Box w/ Lid	\$ 192.16	\$ 195.01	\$ 236.09		\$ 227.24
11	Valve Box Lids Marked "Water"	\$ 19.22	\$ 19.51	\$ 23.61		\$ 19.45
12	Valve Box Lids Marked "Sewer"	\$ 19.22	\$ 19.51	\$ 23.61		\$ 19.45
13	1" Paving Risers Less Lid	\$ 14.07	\$ 14.28	\$ 17.29		\$ 14.24
14	1 1/2" Paving Risers Less Lid	\$ 15.74	\$ 15.99	\$ 19.34		\$ 15.93
15	2" Paving Risers Less Lid	\$ 18.11	\$ 18.38	\$ 22.24		\$ 18.32
16	3" Paving Risers Less Lid	\$ 28.54	\$ 28.96	\$ 35.06		\$ 28.88
17	4" Paving Risers Less Lid	\$ 34.24	\$ 34.76	\$ 42.07		\$ 34.65
18	Rite Hite Paving Risers Less Lid	\$ 39.21	\$ 39.79	\$ 48.17		\$ 39.68
	Total	\$ 714.06	\$ 722.27	\$ 883.90	No Bid	\$ 740.99
SECTION 8 - Miscellaneous						
1	4' Mueller H10322 Curb Box Key	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 38.75
2	6' Mueller H10322 Curb Box Key					\$ 45.54
3	4' Shut-off Rod					\$ 58.55
4	6' Shut-off Rod					\$ 58.99
5	6' P525 Buffalo Box Cleaner					\$ 122.50
6	6' P527 Valve Box Cleaner					\$ 301.57
7	6' T-Handle Millennium Gate Valve Key w/3' Handle					\$ 128.00
8	6' T-Handle Standard Gate Valve Key w/3' Handle					\$ 61.94
9	Ratcheting Gate Valve key, 6' Solid Shaft w/ swivel 2" socket					\$ 277.50
10	4-way Multi-Wrench					\$ 30.40
11	Harrington Permanent Hydrant Storz Adapter (or equivalent)					\$ 234.36
12	Brass Cleanout Cap (2"Nut)					\$ 10.94
13	Brass Cleanout Cap (Recessed)					\$ 10.94
14	4' X 3/8" Fiberglass Shaft Hydrant Marker with Bonnet Mounting Hardware and					\$ 26.66
15	In-fact Foster Adaptor 4"					\$ 71.06
16	In-fact Foster Adaptor 6"					\$ 94.06
17	In-fact Foster Adaptor 8"					\$ 136.42
18	In-fact Foster Adaptor 10"					\$ 188.84
19	In-fact Foster Adaptor 12"					\$ 194.39
20	In-fact Flex Adaptor, 6-inch MJ x MJ w/Accessories					\$ 182.30
21	In-fact Valve Box Mud Plugs					\$ 7.68
22	Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 4' Bury					\$ 952.06
23	Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 4.5' Bury					\$ 965.30
24	Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 5' Bury					\$ 978.53
	Total	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5,177.28
SECTION 9 - Sewer Treatment Plant Parts						
1	4" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 892.41
2	6" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve					\$ 1,297.20
3	8" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve					\$ 1,708.90
4	4" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket					\$ 1.25
5	6" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket					\$ 2.07
6	8" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket					\$ 3.00
7	3/4" X 3" bolts with lock nuts					\$ 0.68
8	3/4" heavy hex nut					\$ 0.44
9	4" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel					\$ 1,985.00
10	6" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel					\$ 1,745.00
11	8" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel					\$ 2,782.82
12	4" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel					\$ 2,455.24
13	6" Victaulic Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel					\$ 2,105.75
14	8" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel					\$ 3,692.59

Township of Livingston
 BID 010-2021 - Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 BID ABSTRACT
 Bid Opening - July 7, 2021 - 11:00AM
 Prepared By: Nathan Kiracofe, Utility Engineer

		Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.	Atlantic Plumbing Supply	Capitol Supply Construction Inc	Raritan Group Inc.	Core & Main
		190 Oberlin Ave, Lakewood, NJ 08701	702 Joline Ave, Longbranch, NJ 07740	149 Old Turnpike Road, Wayne, NJ 07470	PO Box 10120, New Brunswick, NJ 08906	660 State Highway 23, PO Box 306, Pompton Plains, NJ 07444
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
15	6" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve					\$ 926.42
16	8" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve					\$ 1,532.85
17	Mueller 2-1/8" Post Fire Hydrant A-411, one-way					\$ 1,907.22
Total		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23,038.84