

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|--|---|------------------|
| SECTION 1 - Pipe | | |
| 1 | 4" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft | \$40.00 |
| 2 | 6" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft | \$31 |
| 3 | 8" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft | \$ 43.00 |
| 4 | 10" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft | \$ 56.00 |
| 5 | 12" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft | \$ 71.00 |
| 6 | 16" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft | \$ 100.00 |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | \$ 298.00 |
| SECTION 2 - Fittings | | |
| 1 | 6" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 347.00 |
| 2 | 8" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 550.00 |
| 3 | 8" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs | \$ 659.00 |
| 4 | 10" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 740.00 |
| 5 | 10" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 832.00 |
| 6 | 12" X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 930.00 |
| 7 | 12" X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 1,032.00 |
| 8 | 12" X 10" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 2,295.00 |
| 9 | 12" X 12" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 935.00 |
| 10 | 6" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 233.00 |
| 11 | 8" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 300.00 |
| 12 | 10" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 394.00 |
| 13 | 12" X 6" Hydrant Tee w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 470.00 |
| 14 | 4" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 150.00 |
| 15 | 6" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 211.00 |
| 16 | 8" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 287.00 |
| 17 | 10" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 400.00 |
| 18 | 12" compact MJ 11 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 545.00 |
| 19 | 4" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 150.00 |
| 20 | 6" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 210.00 |
| 21 | 8" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 297.00 |
| 22 | 10" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 426.00 |
| 23 | 12" compact MJ 22 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 560.00 |
| 24 | 4" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 155.00 |
| 25 | 6" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 214.00 |
| 26 | 8" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 300.00 |
| 27 | 10" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 245.00 |
| 28 | 12" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 593.00 |
| 29 | 4" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 168.00 |
| 30 | 6" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 230.00 |
| 31 | 8" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 326.00 |
| 32 | 10" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 486.00 |
| 33 | 12" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 646.00 |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|--|--|---------------------|
| 34 | 4" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 160.00 |
| 35 | 6" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 223.00 |
| 36 | 8" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 327.00 |
| 37 | 10" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 430.00 |
| 38 | 12" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs. | \$ 573.00 |
| 39 | 6" compact MJ Swivel Adapt. | \$ 232.00 |
| 40 | 4" compact MJ Plug | \$ 30.00 |
| 41 | 6" compact MJ Plug | \$ 57.00 |
| 42 | 8" compact MJ Plug | \$ 84.00 |
| 43 | 10" compact MJ Plug | \$ 145.00 |
| 44 | 12" compact MJ Plug | \$ 258.00 |
| 45 | 4" compact MJ Cap | \$ 95.00 |
| 46 | 6" compact MJ Cap | \$ 140.00 |
| 47 | 8" compact MJ Cap | \$ 210.00 |
| 48 | 10" compact MJ Cap | \$ 278.00 |
| 49 | 12" compact MJ Cap | \$ 393.00 |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | \$ 19,951.00 |
| SECTION 3 - Valves & Hydrants | | |
| 1 | 4" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs. | \$ 1,060.00 |
| 2 | 6" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs. | \$ 1,310.00 |
| 3 | 8" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs. | \$ 1,895.00 |
| 4 | 10" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs. | \$ 2,781.00 |
| 5 | 12" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs. | \$ 3,461.00 |
| 6 | 4" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box | \$ 1,165.00 |
| 7 | 6" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box | \$ 1,538.00 |
| 8 | 8" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box | \$ 2,160.00 |
| 9 | 10" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box | \$ 3,370.00 |
| 10 | 12" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box | \$ 4,910.00 |
| 11 | Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4' Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle | \$ 3,639.00 |
| 12 | Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle | \$ 3,750.00 |
| 13 | Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5' 0" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle | \$ 3,825.00 |
| 14 | Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle | \$ 3,900.00 |
| 15 | Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 6' Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle | \$ 4,300.00 |
| 16 | Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 6' 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs. and Storz pumper nozzle | \$ 4,150.00 |
| 17 | 6" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete | \$ 585.00 |
| 18 | 12" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete | \$ 685.00 |
| 19 | 18" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete | \$ 775.00 |
| 20 | 24" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete | \$ 875.00 |
| 21 | 36" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete | \$ 1,240.00 |
| 22 | 6" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 615.00 |
| 23 | 12" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 760.00 |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|--|--|---------------------|
| 24 | 24" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 900.00 |
| 25 | 36" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 1,245.00 |
| 26 | 6" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 535.00 |
| 27 | 12" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 620.00 |
| 28 | 24" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 750.00 |
| 29 | 36" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved) | \$ 1,300.00 |
| 30 | Mueller 280359 Main Valve Repair Kit | \$ 600.00 |
| 31 | Mueller 280367 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved) | \$ 900.00 |
| 32 | Mueller 280366 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved) | \$ 750.00 |
| 33 | Mueller A301 Safety Flange Repair Kit | \$ 290.00 |
| 34 | Mueller A301-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved) | \$ 290.00 |
| 35 | Mueller A300-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved) | \$ 260.00 |
| 36 | Mueller 280355 Bonnet Repair Kit | \$ 90.00 |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | \$ 18,215.00 |
| SECTION 4 - Repair Clamps & Couplings | | |
| 1 | 4"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 59.00 |
| 2 | 6"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 68.00 |
| 3 | 8"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 83.00 |
| 4 | 10"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 101.00 |
| 5 | 12"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 114.00 |
| 6 | 4"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 96.00 |
| 7 | 6" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 115.00 |
| 8 | 8" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 135.00 |
| 9 | 10" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 152.00 |
| 10 | 12" X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 178.00 |
| 11 | 4" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 115.00 |
| 12 | 6" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 128.00 |
| 13 | 8" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 158.00 |
| 14 | 10" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 197.00 |
| 15 | 12" X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 228.00 |
| 16 | 4" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 156.00 |
| 17 | 6" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 186.00 |
| 18 | 8" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 218.00 |
| 19 | 10" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 265.00 |
| 20 | 12" X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 300.00 |
| 21 | 4" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 87.00 |
| 22 | 6" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 98.00 |
| 23 | 8" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 110.00 |
| 24 | 10" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 130.00 |
| 25 | 12" X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 142.00 |
| 26 | 4" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 124.00 |
| 27 | 6" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 140.00 |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|------|--|-------------|
| 28 | 8" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 161.00 |
| 29 | 10" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 185.00 |
| 30 | 12" X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 210.00 |
| 31 | 4" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 87.00 |
| 32 | 6" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 98.00 |
| 33 | 8" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 110.00 |
| 34 | 10" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 130.00 |
| 35 | 12" X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 142.00 |
| 36 | 4" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 124.00 |
| 37 | 6" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 140.00 |
| 38 | 8" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 161.00 |
| 39 | 10" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 185.00 |
| 40 | 12" X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile) | \$ 210.00 |
| 41 | 4.80" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 325.00 |
| 42 | 6.90" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 348.00 |
| 43 | 6.90" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 461.00 |
| 44 | 9.05" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 375.00 |
| 45 | 9.05" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 490.00 |
| 46 | 11.10" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 400.00 |
| 47 | 11.10" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 575.00 |
| 48 | 13.20" x 3" Powerseal 3436AS 3/4" & 1" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 462.00 |
| 49 | 13.20" x 6" Powerseal 3436AS 1-1/2" & 2" Corp Termination Sleeve | \$ 530.00 |
| 50 | 4" Hymax 2 Coupling | \$ 200.00 |
| 51 | 6" Hymax 2 Coupling | \$ 260.00 |
| 52 | 8" Hymax 2 Coupling | \$ 295.00 |
| 53 | 10" Hymax 2 Coupling | \$ 380.00 |
| 54 | 12" Hymax 2 Coupling | \$ 395.00 |
| 55 | 4" X 6" Hymax 2 Reducer | \$ 325.00 |
| 56 | 6" X 8" Hymax 2 Reducer | \$ 370.00 |
| 57 | 8" X 10" Hymax 2 Reducer | \$ 480.00 |
| 58 | 10" X 12" Hymax 2 Reducer | \$ 510.00 |
| 59 | 4" Hymax Grip Coupling | \$ 250.00 |
| 60 | 6" Hymax Grip Coupling | \$ 340.00 |
| 61 | 8" Hymax Grip Coupling | \$ 438.00 |
| 62 | 10" Hymax Grip Coupling | \$ 550.00 |
| 63 | 12" Hymax Grip Coupling | \$ 635.00 |
| 64 | 4" X 6" Hymax Grip Reducer | \$ 485.00 |
| 65 | 6" X 8" Hymax Grip Reducer | \$ 580.00 |
| 66 | 8" X 10" Hymax Grip Reducer | \$ 725.00 |
| 67 | 10" X 12" Hymax Grip Reducer | \$ 800.00 |
| 68 | 4" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint | \$ 660.00 |
| 69 | 6" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint | \$ 840.00 |
| 70 | 8" Hymax Grip Swivel Joint | \$ 1,200.00 |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|--|--|---------------------|
| 71 | 4" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve | \$ 250.00 |
| 72 | 6" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve | \$ 320.00 |
| 73 | 8" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve | \$ 420.00 |
| 74 | 10" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve | \$ 530.00 |
| 75 | 12" Hymax Grip MJ Cut-in Sleeve | \$ 620.00 |
| 76 | 4" Hymax Grip End Cap | \$ 170.00 |
| 77 | 6" Hymax Grip End Cap | \$ 230.00 |
| 78 | 8" Hymax Grip End Cap | \$ 320.00 |
| 79 | 10" Hymax Grip End Cap | \$ 480.00 |
| 80 | 12" Hymax Grip End Cap | \$ 535.00 |
| 81 | 6" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40") | \$ 110.00 |
| 82 | 8" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40") | \$ 135.00 |
| 83 | 10" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53") | \$ 175.00 |
| 84 | 12" x 9" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55") | \$ 210.00 |
| 85 | 6" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40") | \$ 190.00 |
| 86 | 8" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40") | \$ 210.00 |
| 87 | 10" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53") | \$ 265.00 |
| 88 | 12" x 12" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55") | \$ 320.00 |
| 89 | 6" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40") | \$ 200.00 |
| 90 | 8" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40") | \$ 240.00 |
| 91 | 10" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53") | \$ 315.00 |
| 92 | 12" x 15" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55") | \$ 370.00 |
| 93 | 6" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 6.60" to 7.40") | \$ 420.00 |
| 94 | 8" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 8.60" to 9.40") | \$ 510.00 |
| 95 | 10" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 10.73" to 11.53") | \$ 590.00 |
| 96 | 12" x 24" Hymax Clamp (OD 12.75" to 13.55") | \$ 650.00 |
| 97 | 6"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 668.00 |
| 98 | 8"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 745.00 |
| 99 | 10"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 810.00 |
| 100 | 12"X6" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 870.00 |
| 101 | 8"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 1,075.00 |
| 102 | 10"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 1,320.00 |
| 103 | 12"X8" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 1,540.00 |
| 104 | 10"X10" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 1,980.00 |
| 105 | 12"X10" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 1,945.00 |
| 106 | 12"X12" Powerseal 3490AS MJ Tapping Sleeve (Ductile) | \$ 2,099.00 |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | \$ 42,347.00 |
| SECTION 5 - Water Service Parts | | |
| 1 | 3/4" Mueller H15008N Ground Key Corp Valve | \$ 50.00 |
| 2 | 1" Mueller H15008N Ground Key Corp Valve | \$ 74.00 |
| 3 | 1 1/2" Mueller H15013N Ori-Corp Corp Valve | \$ 212.00 |
| 4 | 2" Mueller H15013N Ori-Corp Corp Valve | \$ 350.00 |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|------|--|------------|
| 5 | 3/4" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop | \$ 98.00 |
| 6 | 1" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop | \$ 165.00 |
| 7 | 1 1/2" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop | \$ 340.00 |
| 8 | 2" Mueller H15209N Oriseal Curb Stop | \$ 505.00 |
| 9 | 3/4" Mueller H15403 Union | \$ 30.00 |
| 10 | 1" Mueller H15403 Union | \$ 32.00 |
| 11 | 1 1/2" H154303 Union | \$ 110.00 |
| 12 | 2" Mueller H15403 Union | \$ 143.00 |
| 13 | 3/4" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter | \$ 23.00 |
| 14 | 1" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter | \$ 27.00 |
| 15 | 1 1/2" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter | \$ 72.00 |
| 16 | 2" Mueller H15428 Male Adapter | \$ 104.00 |
| 17 | 3/4" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter | \$ 24.00 |
| 18 | 1" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter | \$ 33.00 |
| 19 | 1 1/2" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter | \$ 92.00 |
| 20 | 2" Mueller H15451 Female Adapter | \$ 108.00 |
| 21 | 3/4" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend | \$ 34.00 |
| 22 | 1" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend | \$ 42.00 |
| 23 | 1 1/2" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend | \$ 142.00 |
| 24 | 2" Mueller H15526 Compression Quarter Bend | \$ 285.00 |
| 25 | 3/4" Mueller H-15528 Compression Eighth Bend | \$ 60.00 |
| 26 | 1" Mueller H-15528 Compression Eighth Bend | \$ 72.00 |
| 27 | 3/4" Type K Copper Pipe (Price per Ft) | \$ 7.50 |
| 28 | 1" Type K Copper Pipe (Price per Ft) | \$ 12.00 |
| 29 | 1 1/2" Type K Copper (Price per Ft) | \$ 17.00 |
| 30 | 2" Type K Copper (Price per Ft) | \$ 25.00 |
| 31 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 1" 406-0663 X 09 | \$ 75.00 |
| 32 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 1" 406-0690 X 09 | \$ 75.00 |
| 33 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 1" 406-0745 X 09 | \$ 75.00 |
| 34 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0663 X 13 | \$ 89.00 |
| 35 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0690 X 13 | \$ 89.00 |
| 36 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 1-1/2" 406-0745 X 13 | \$ 89.00 |
| 37 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.50 - 6.63) 6" x 2" 406-0663 X 15 | \$ 89.00 |
| 38 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.63 - 6.90) 6" x 2" 406-0690 X 15 | \$ 89.00 |
| 39 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 6.84 - 7.60) 6" x 2" 406-0745 X 15 | \$ 89.00 |
| 40 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 1" 406-0863 X 09 | \$ 104.00 |
| 41 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 1" 406-0905 X 09 | \$ 104.00 |
| 42 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 1" 406-0963 X 09 | \$ 104.00 |
| 43 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0863 X 13 | \$ 104.00 |
| 44 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0905 X 13 | \$ 104.00 |
| 45 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 1-1/2" 406-0963 X 13 | \$ 104.00 |
| 46 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.50 - 8.63) 8" x 2" 406-0863 X 15 | \$ 104.00 |
| 47 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.63 - 9.05) 8" x 2" 406-0905 X 15 | \$ 104.00 |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|--|---|--------------------|
| 48 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 8.99 - 9.79) 8" x 2" 406-0963 X 15 | \$ 106.00 |
| 49 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 1" 406-1075 X 09 | \$ 106.00 |
| 50 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 1" 406-1110 X 09 | \$ 106.00 |
| 51 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 1" 406-1140 X 09 | \$ 106.00 |
| 52 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 1" 406-1225 X 09 | \$ 106.00 |
| 53 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1075 X 13 | \$ 120.00 |
| 54 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1110 X 13 | \$ 120.00 |
| 55 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1140 X 13 | \$ 120.00 |
| 56 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 1-1/2" 406-1225 X 13 | \$ 120.00 |
| 57 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.60 - 10.75) 10" x 2" 406-1075 X 15 | \$ 120.00 |
| 58 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 10.75 - 11.10) 10" x 2" 406-1110 X 15 | \$ 120.00 |
| 59 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.10 - 11.40) 10" x 2" 406-1140 X 15 | \$ 120.00 |
| 60 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 11.00 - 12.25) 10" x 2" 406-1225 X 15 | \$ 120.00 |
| 61 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 1" 406-1320 X 09 | \$ 120.00 |
| 62 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 1" 406-1350 X 09 | \$ 120.00 |
| 63 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 1" 406-1426 X 09 | \$ 120.00 |
| 64 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1320 X 13 | \$ 140.00 |
| 65 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1350 X 13 | \$ 140.00 |
| 66 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 1-1/2" 406-1426 X 13 | \$ 140.00 |
| 67 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.20) 12" x 2" 406-1320 X 15 | \$ 140.00 |
| 68 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 12.75 - 13.50) 12" x 2" 406-1350 X 15 | \$ 140.00 |
| 69 | JCM 406 Service Saddle w/ CC Thread (OD 13.10 - 14.38) 12" x 2" 406-1426 X 15 | \$ 140.00 |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | \$ 7,569.50 |
| SECTION 6 - Valve & Service Box Parts | | |
| 1 | Bingham & Taylor Series 300 - P304 Adjustable 3" Plastic and Cast Iron Buffalo Curb Box (52" -58") w/ standard arch and old style water lid | \$ 87.00 |
| 2 | Bingham & Taylor Series 300 - P326 24" Extension | \$ 17.00 |
| 3 | Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Buffalo Curb Box (40"-60") w/ old style water lid | \$ 130.00 |
| 4 | Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Curb Box – Extension 151 – 9.5" | \$ 30.00 |
| 5 | Bingham & Taylor – 94-E Adjustable 2-1/2" Cast Iron Curb Box – Extension 152 – 16.5" | \$ 36.00 |
| 6 | CP Test - 253LMK1824 Adjustable 3" Cast Iron and Plastic Locking Curb Box (43"-57") | \$ 53.00 |
| 7 | New Style Buffalo Box Repair Lid | \$ 36.00 |
| 8 | Old Style Buffalo Box Repair Lid | \$ 36.00 |
| 9 | Mueller A802 Repair Lid for Mueller Extension Type Curb Box | \$ 18.00 |
| 10 | 3-5' 2 Piece Screw Type Valve Box w/ Lid | \$ 260.00 |
| 11 | Valve Box Lids Marked "Water" | \$ 27.00 |
| 12 | Valve Box Lids Marked "Sewer" | \$ 27.00 |
| 13 | 1" Paving Risers Less Lid | \$ 20.00 |
| 14 | 1 1/2" Paving Risers Less Lid | \$ 22.00 |
| 15 | 2" Paving Risers Less Lid | \$ 24.00 |
| 16 | 3" Paving Risers Less Lid | \$ 48.00 |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|--|--|--------------------|
| 17 | 4" Paving Risers Less Lid | \$ 48.00 |
| 18 | Rite Hite Paving Risers Less Lid | \$ 55.00 |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | \$ 974.00 |
| SECTION 7 - Miscellaneous | | |
| 1 | 4' Mueller H10322 Curb Box Key | \$ 77.00 |
| 2 | 6' Mueller H10322 Curb Box Key | \$ 110.00 |
| 3 | 4' Shut-off Rod | \$ 90.00 |
| 4 | 6' Shut-off Rod | \$ 110.00 |
| 5 | 6' P525 Buffalo Box Cleaner | \$ 130.00 |
| 6 | 6' P527 Valve Box Cleaner | \$ 260.00 |
| 7 | 6' T-Handle Millennium Gate Valve Key w/3' Handle | \$ 220.00 |
| 8 | 6' T-Handle Standard Gate Valve Key w/3' Handle | \$ 110.00 |
| 9 | Ratcheting Gate Valve key, 6' Solid Shaft w/ swivel 2" socket | \$300.00 |
| 10 | 4-way Multi-Wrench | \$ 80.00 |
| 11 | Harrington Permanent Hydrant Storz Adapter (or equivalent) | \$ 260.00 |
| 12 | Brass Cleanout Cap (2"Nut) | \$ 17.00 |
| 13 | Brass Cleanout Cap (Recessed) | \$ 17.00 |
| 14 | 4' X 3/8" Fiberglass Shaft Hydrant Marker with Bonnet Mounting Hardware and Spring | \$ 50.00 |
| 15 | In-fact Foster Adaptor 4" | \$ 95.00 |
| 16 | In-fact Foster Adaptor 6" | \$ 120.00 |
| 17 | In-fact Foster Adaptor 8" | \$ 170.00 |
| 18 | In-fact Foster Adaptor 10" | \$ 240.00 |
| 19 | In-fact Foster Adaptor 12" | \$ 260.00 |
| 20 | In-fact Flex Adaptor, 6-inch MJ x MJ w/Accessories | \$ 280.00 |
| 21 | In-fact Valve Box Mud Plugs | \$ 8.00 |
| 22 | Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 4' Bury | \$1,200.00 |
| 23 | Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 4.5' Bury | \$1,225.00 |
| 24 | Kupferle Cold Climate Sampling Station Eclipse #88-SS 5' Bury | \$1,280.00 |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | \$ 6,709.00 |
| SECTION 8 - Sewer Treatment Plant Parts | | |
| 1 | 4" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve | NO BID |
| 2 | 6" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve | NO BID |
| 3 | 8" Crispin Model 800 Plug Valve | NO BID |
| 4 | 4" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket | NO BID |
| 5 | 6" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket | NO BID |
| 6 | 8" Red Rubber Full Face Gasket | NO BID |
| 7 | 3/4" X 3" bolts with lock nuts | NO BID |
| 8 | 3/4" heavy hex nut | NO BID |
| 9 | 4" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel | NO BID |
| 10 | 6" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel | NO BID |
| 11 | 8" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Handwheel | NO BID |

Township of Livingston
 BID 10 - 2022 Water & Sewer Parts - Open Ended Contract
 Electronic Bid Spreadsheet
 Bid Opening - June 29, 2022

Ferguson Water Works

7 Oak Glen rd. Howell NJ 07731

| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PRICE |
|--|--|------------|
| 12 | 4" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel | NO BID |
| 13 | 6" Victaulic Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel | NO BID |
| 14 | 8" Victaulic IC Series 365 Plug Valve for AWWA – gear operator w/ Chainwheel | NO BID |
| 15 | 4" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve | NO BID |
| 16 | 6" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve | NO BID |
| 17 | 8" Matco-Norca 120WC Ductile Iron Flanged Check Valve | NO BID |
| 18 | Mueller 2-1/8" Post Fire Hydrant A-411, one-way | NO BID |
| ENTER Unit Price Total Here -> | | |