

Township of Livingston
BID 006-2014 - Fire Hydrant Parts- Open Ended Contract
BID ABSTRACT
Bid Opening - March 12, 2014 - 11:00AM

Prepared By: Karen Sullivan, Purchasing Manager

Capitol Supply Construction Products, Inc.	Water Works Supply Company, Inc.	Campbell Foundry Company
55 Hornbeck Road	660 State Highway 23	800 Bergen Street
	PO Box 306	
Denville, NJ 07834	Pompton Plains, NJ 07444	Harrison, NJ 07029
UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
SECTION 1				
1	4" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$17.99	\$19.98	No Bid
2	6" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$15.30	\$16.98	No Bid
3	8" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$21.25	\$23.64	No Bid
4	10" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$28.25	\$31.38	No Bid
5	12" Class 52 Tyton Ductile Iron Pipe /Ft	\$35.30	\$37.24	No Bid
SECTION 2				
1	6"X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$246.33	\$238.36	\$205.00
2	6"X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$306.70	\$300.12	\$254.00
3	10"X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$341.99	\$383.57	\$330.00
4	12"X 12" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$739.15	\$740.92	\$574.00
5	12"X 10" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$695.77	\$696.60	\$551.00
6	12"X 8" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$582.22	\$580.20	\$464.00
7	12"X 6" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$550.60	\$547.80	\$418.00
8	12"X 4" compact MJ Tees w/Megalug Accs.	\$511.48	\$502.17	\$414.00
9	4" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$107.37	\$103.57	\$91.00
10	6" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$150.08	\$144.19	\$125.00
11	8" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$209.21	\$204.43	\$176.00
12	10" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$300.00	\$293.39	\$254.00
13	12" compact MJ 45 w/Megalug Accs.	\$469.69	\$469.61	\$360.00
14	4" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$118.19	\$114.98	\$98.00
15	6" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$167.59	\$162.46	\$138.00
16	8" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$238.77	\$235.64	\$196.00
17	10" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$385.81	\$383.96	\$296.00
18	12" compact MJ 90 w/Megalug Accs.	\$545.39	\$549.53	\$410.00
19	4" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$113.14	\$109.66	\$94.00
20	6" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$155.32	\$149.52	\$132.00
21	8" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$206.33	\$201.39	\$197.00
22	10" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$302.89	\$296.43	\$257.00
23	12" compact MJ Sleeve w/Megalug Accs.	\$407.68	\$404.16	\$346.00
24	6" compact MJ Swivel Adapt.	\$120.26	\$208.31	\$149.00
25	4" compact MJ Plug	\$37.49	\$37.49	\$18.00
26	6" compact MJ Plug	\$59.84	\$59.85	\$37.00
27	8" compact MJ Plug	\$85.08	\$85.08	\$55.00
28	10" compact MJ Plug	\$109.60	\$109.60	\$98.00
29	12" compact MJ Plug	\$138.52	\$131.23	\$95.00
SECTION 3				
1	4" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$661.99	\$647.37	No Bid
2	6" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$812.17	\$794.26	No Bid
3	8" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$1,211.95	\$1,195.33	No Bid
4	10" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$1,815.75	\$1,744.06	No Bid
5	12" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/ Box and Megalug Accs.	\$2,278.16	\$2,259.99	No Bid
6	4" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/Aquagrip and Box	\$986.25	No Bid	No Bid
7	6" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/Aquagrip and Box	\$1,222.59	No Bid	No Bid
8	8" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/Aquagrip and Box	\$1,757.83	No Bid	No Bid
9	10" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/Aquagrip and Box	\$2,840.57	No Bid	No Bid
10	12" MJ RW Gate Valve Open Left w/Aquagrip and Box	\$3,415.89	No Bid	No Bid
11	4" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$743.56	\$780.45	No Bid
12	6" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$1,004.28	\$1,053.88	No Bid
13	8" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$1,437.10	\$1,511.60	No Bid
14	10" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$2,111.07	\$2,223.39	No Bid
15	12" MJ RW Tapping Valve Open Left w/ Box	\$3,132.38	\$3,298.05	No Bid
16	4"X4" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$704.11	\$718.94	No Bid
17	6"X4" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$837.09	\$854.73	No Bid
18	8"X4" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$1,028.18	\$1,049.81	No Bid
19	10"X4" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,033.54	\$2,076.35	No Bid
20	12"X4" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,033.54	\$2,076.35	No Bid
21	6"X6" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$837.09	\$854.73	No Bid
22	8"X6" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$1,028.18	\$1,049.81	No Bid
23	10"X6" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,033.54	\$2,076.35	No Bid
24	12"X6" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,033.54	\$2,076.35	No Bid
25	8"X8" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$1,112.97	\$1,136.40	No Bid
26	10"X8" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,160.77	\$2,206.35	No Bid
27	12"X8" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,160.77	\$2,206.35	No Bid
28	10"X10" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,203.09	\$2,249.47	No Bid
29	12"X10" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,499.59	\$2,552.21	No Bid
30	12"X12" Mueller H615 MJ Tapping Sleeve	\$2,569.71	\$2,623.81	No Bid
31	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4" Bury w/Megalug Accs.	\$2,161.59	\$2,244.57	No Bid
32	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4" 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs.	\$2,210.93	\$2,295.99	No Bid
33	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4" 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs.	\$2,260.38	\$2,385.05	No Bid
34	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5" 6" Bury w/Megalug Accs.	\$2,309.77	\$2,604.95	No Bid
35	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4" Bury w/Aquagrip Shoe	\$2,917.87	No Bid	No Bid
36	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 4" 6" Bury w/Aquagrip Shoe	\$2,982.32	No Bid	No Bid
37	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5" 0" Bury w/Aquagrip Shoe	\$3,046.96	No Bid	No Bid
38	Fire Hydrant Mueller A423 5" 6" Bury w/Aquagrip Shoe	\$3,111.47	No Bid	No Bid
39	6" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$357.84	\$307.14	No Bid
40	12" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$421.06	\$361.16	No Bid
41	18" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$476.83	\$408.88	No Bid
42	24" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$536.60	\$459.92	No Bid
43	36" Mueller A320 Extension Kit Complete	\$841.27	\$720.68	No Bid
44	6" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$357.84	\$307.14	No Bid
45	12" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$421.06	\$361.16	No Bid
46	24" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$536.60	\$408.88	No Bid
47	36" Mueller A320-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$841.30	\$459.92	No Bid
48	6" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$325.36	\$279.25	No Bid
49	12" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$378.39	\$324.93	No Bid
50	24" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$457.42	\$392.78	No Bid
51	36" Mueller A319-00 Extension Kit Complete (Improved)	\$797.12	\$683.71	No Bid
52	Mueller 280359 Main Valve Repair Kit	\$324.67	\$307.57	No Bid
53	Mueller 280367 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved)	\$474.19	\$449.23	No Bid
54	Mueller 280366 Main Valve Repair Kit (Improved)	\$401.57	\$380.42	No Bid
55	Mueller A301 Safety Flange Repair Kit	\$142.16	\$134.67	No Bid
56	Mueller A301-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved)	\$142.16	\$134.67	No Bid
57	Mueller A300-00 Safety Flange Repair Kit (Improved)	\$142.16	\$134.67	No Bid
58	Mueller 280355 Bonnet Repair Kit	\$49.61	\$47.00	No Bid
SECTION 4				
1	4"X4" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$366.36	\$377.33	No Bid
2	6"X4" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$421.96	\$426.16	No Bid
3	8"X4" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$434.71	\$447.29	No Bid
4	10"X4" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$503.81	\$492.94	No Bid
5	12"X4" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$562.30	\$550.35	No Bid
6	6"X6" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$452.06	\$459.00	No Bid
7	8"X6" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$471.18	\$462.00	No Bid
8	10"X6" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$545.52	\$541.46	No Bid
9	12"X6" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$623.41	\$639.18	No Bid
10	8"X8" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$603.39	\$578.04	No Bid
11	10"X8" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$662.82	\$670.69	No Bid
12	12"X8" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$782.16	\$769.13	No Bid
13	10"X10" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$1,012.64	\$965.28	No Bid
14	12"X10" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$992.53	\$1,000.93	No Bid
15	12"X12" Powerseal 3490AS Tapping Sleeve (Ductile)	\$1,150.61	\$1,051.77	No Bid
16	4" Powerseal 3501 Coupling (Ductile to Ductile)	\$41.08	\$46.87	No Bid
17	6" Powerseal 3501 Coupling (Ductile to Ductile)	\$54.71	\$55.57	No Bid
18	8" Powerseal 3501 Coupling (Ductile to Ductile)	\$69.18	\$74.21	No Bid
19	10" Powerseal 3501 Coupling (Ductile to Ductile)	\$87.06	\$111.35	No Bid
20	12" Powerseal 3501 Coupling (Ductile to Ductile)	\$119.90	\$146.61	No Bid
21	4" Hymax Couplings (4.25-5.63 OD)	\$140.33	\$131.46	No Bid
22	6" Hymax Couplings (6.42-7.68 OD)	\$185.83	\$174.09	No Bid
23	8" Hymax Couplings (8.54-9.84 OD)	\$209.81	\$196.56	No Bid
24	10" Hymax Couplings (10.70-12.00 OD)	\$269.91	\$252.86	No Bid
25	12" Hymax Couplings (13.15-14.41 OD)	\$388.75	\$364.20	No Bid
26	4"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$35.52	\$43.97	No Bid
27	6"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$41.92	\$51.12	No Bid
28	8"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$52.24	\$58.82	No Bid
29	10"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$66.13	\$68.46	No Bid
30	12"X 8" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$77.46	\$68.78	No Bid
31	4"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$63.07	\$62.33	No Bid
32	6"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$69.86	\$70.74	No Bid
33	8"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$83.67	\$82.86	No Bid
34	10"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$94.82	\$93.11	No Bid
35	12"X 12" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$120.04	\$101.16	No Bid
36	4"X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$73.17	\$80.66	No Bid
37	6"X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$84.42	\$89.42	No Bid
38	8"X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$99.69	\$106.22	No Bid
39	10"X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$119.50	\$118.77	No Bid
40	12"X 16" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$149.18	\$124.00	No Bid
41	4"X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$98.26	\$108.36	No Bid
42	6"X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$103.51	\$123.27	No Bid
43	8"X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$138.11	\$145.17	No Bid
44	10"X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$166.43	\$166.53	No Bid
45	12"X 20" Powerseal 3121 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$204.61	\$176.44	No Bid
46	4"X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$54.69	No Bid	No Bid
47	6"X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$61.36	No Bid	No Bid
48	8"X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$67.13	No Bid	No Bid
49	10"X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$84.52	No Bid	No Bid
50	12"X 8" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$92.98	No Bid	No Bid
51	4"X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$78.32	No Bid	No Bid
52	6"X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$84.03	No Bid	No Bid
53	8"X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$97.29	No Bid	No Bid
54	10"X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$121.11	No Bid	No Bid
55	12"X 12" X 3/4" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$133.11	No Bid	No Bid
56	4"X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$45.93	No Bid	No Bid
57	6"X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$49.08	No Bid	No Bid
58	8"X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$50.34	No Bid	No Bid
59	10"X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$84.52	No Bid	No Bid
60	12"X 8" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$92.98	No Bid	No Bid
61	4"X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$78.32	No Bid	No Bid
62	6"X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$84.03	No Bid	No Bid
63	8"X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$97.29	No Bid	No Bid
64	10"X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$121.11	No Bid	No Bid
65	12"X 12" X 1" Powerseal 3131 Iron Lug Repair Clamp (Ductile)	\$133.11	No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 5				
1	3/4" Mueller H15008 Corp Stop	\$26.11	\$26.14	No Bid
2	1" Mueller H15008 Corp Stop	\$39.59	\$39.59	No Bid
3	1 1/2" Mueller H15013 Corp Stop	\$115.94	\$115.94	No Bid
4	2" Mueller H15013 Corp Stop	\$191.79	\$191.79	No Bid
5	3/4" Mueller H15209 Curb Stop	\$53.51	\$53.51	No Bid
6	1" Mueller H15209 Curb Stop	\$88.44	\$88.44	No Bid
7	1 1/2" Mueller H15209 Curb Stop	\$185.95	\$185.95	No Bid
8	2" Mueller H15209 Curb Stop	\$275.26	\$275.26	No Bid
9	3/4" Mueller H15403 Union	\$14.60	\$14.60	No Bid
10	1" Mueller H15403 Union	\$15.94	\$15.94	No Bid
11	1 1/2" H15403 Union	\$56.17		